



COMMUNITY CONSOLIDATED SCHOOL DISTRICT 15

580 N 1st Bank Drive • Palatine IL 60067 | 847.963.3000 | www.ccsd15.net
Michael Adamczyk, SFO, Chief School Business Official • Business & Auxiliary Services

DATE: June 12, 2019

TO: Board of Education

FROM: Michael Adamczyk, CSBO
Ivy Fleming, Budget & Purchasing Coordinator

RE: Action Item – Bid #19-033 Further Processed USDA Commodity Foods and Commercial Equivalents

Background

Bid #19-033 – Further Processed USDA Commodity Foods and Commercial Equivalents – was published in the Daily Herald and posted on the District’s website on April 29, 2019. Specifications were sent to eight vendors and three bids were received back.

Further processed USDA commodity products are not like their commercial equivalents. The District is allotted a dollar amount based on number of lunches served the prior year. Products are then selected to be used in the school meals program. Pounds of raw product are sent (via the USDA) to a manufacturer, who then uses the raw product and turns out finished cases of usable food items. The District is then given a discount off the commercial price of the finished item, which is equivalent to the dollar value of the raw product needed to produce the finished case. This dollar value is established yearly by the USDA.

Currently, the bid for a manufacturer’s item cannot be split between distributors, as the system only allows us to “bank” the value of the product with a single distributor. For example, if the majority of the cheese products from a manufacturer is less expensive from one distributor, then the District must select the distributor with the lowest pricing overall for those products. There can be no line item bids on commodities.

Bid Results

Please see attached.

Recommendation

It is recommended the Board of Education award this bid to Kohl Food Service in the amount of \$326,953.85, PFG in the amount of \$10,561.60, and Gordon Food Service in the amount of \$148,293.45 for a total bid amount of \$485,808.90.

These funds are budgeted in the 2019-20 Nutrition Services budget.

Bid documents are available for review in the Business Office.

FURTHER PROCESSED COMMODITY BID AWARD BY CATEGORY 2019-2020

MANUFACTURER	DISTRIBUTOR	AWARD AMOUNT
Bongards	PFG	\$ 1,416.00
ConAgra/Gilardi	KOHL	\$ 5,701.10
Del Monte Fruit	KOHL	\$ 3,429.00
J&J Flour	KOHL	\$ 13,778.40
Jenni-O	KOHL	\$ 11,962.45
JTM	GFS	\$ 13,507.00
Lamb-Weston - Potatoes	GFS	\$ 2,401.00
Lamb-Weston - Sweet Potatoes	GFS	\$ 3,586.80
McCain - Potatoes	GFS	\$ 25,489.00
McCain - Sweet Potatoes	PFG	\$ 9,145.60
Michaels	KOHL	\$ 32,161.80
Muffintown	KOHL	\$ 2,982.60
Nardone Bros	KOHL	\$ 17,188.05
Pilgrim/Goldkist	KOHL	\$ 75,897.50
Red Gold	KOHL	\$ 22,290.75
Rich Seapak - Flour	GFS	\$ 26,572.65
Rich Seapak - Mozzarella Cheese	KOHL	\$ 5,561.05
SA Piazza	KOHL	\$ 19,395.90
Schwann's	KOHL	\$ 44,262.25
Simplot	KOHL	\$ 8,726.50
Smuckers	GFS	\$ 76,737.00
Sunny Fresh	KOHL	\$ 4,218.70
Tasty Brands	KOHL	\$ 10,269.00
Tyson Advance-Pierre	KOHL	\$ 11,805.00
Tyson Bosco	KOHL	\$ 10,629.30
Tyson Chicken	KOHL	\$ 8,909.00
Yang's Fifth Taste	KOHL	\$ 17,785.50
KOHL FOODSERVICE TOTAL BID AWARD		\$ 326,953.85
PFG TOTAL BID AWARD		\$ 10,561.60
GFS TOTAL BID AWARD		\$ 148,293.45
TOTAL BID AWARD		\$ 485,808.90

EXHIBIT "B" - COMMUNITY CONSOLIDATED SCHOOL DISTRICT 15
 FURTHER PROCESSED USDA COMMODITY FOODS AND COMMERCIAL EQUIVALENTS 2019-2020

	ITEM NUMBER	PRODUCT DESCRIPTION	BID COMMENTS	VENDOR NUMBER	QUANTITY (Cases)	LAI D IN COST	FIXED FEE	PASS THROUGH VALUE	NET DELIVERED PRICE	EXTENSION
BONGARDS	48210	Cheese Curds - Natural Flavor		KOHL	100	\$ 23.40	\$ 2.00	\$ 8.02	\$ 17.38	\$ 1,738.00
				PFG	100	\$ 20.55	\$ 1.64	\$ 8.03	\$ 14.16	\$ 1,416.00
				GFS	100	\$ 21.15	\$ 1.25	\$ 8.02	\$ 14.38	\$ 1,438.00
CONAGRA/	77387-12685	Max Stix Whole Grain		KOHL	120	\$ 39.65	\$ 1.75	\$ 9.82	\$ 31.58	\$ 3,789.60
GILARDI				PFG	120	\$ 39.65	\$ 6.34	\$ 9.82	\$ 36.17	\$ 4,340.40
				GFS	120	\$ 46.40	\$ 1.25	\$ 14.73	\$ 32.92	\$ 3,950.40
	77387-12699	Pizza Quesadilla Cheese WG		KOHL	50	\$ 43.00	\$ 1.75	\$ 6.52	\$ 38.23	\$ 1,911.50
				PFG	50	\$ 43.00	\$ 3.23	\$ 6.52	\$ 39.71	\$ 1,985.50
				GFS	50	\$ 43.00	\$ 1.25	\$ 6.52	\$ 37.73	\$ 1,886.50
DEL MONTE	2004529	Pear Cup		KOHL	100	\$ 23.97	\$ 1.80	\$ 8.45	\$ 17.32	\$ 1,732.00
			ALT TO SPEC	PFG	100	\$ 15.84	\$ 1.17	\$ -	\$ 17.01	\$ 1,701.00
				GFS	100	\$ 25.60	\$ 1.25	\$ 8.45	\$ 18.40	\$ 1,840.00
	2004531	Peach Cup		KOHL	100	\$ 23.97	\$ 1.80	\$ 8.80	\$ 16.97	\$ 1,697.00
			ALT TO SPEC	PFG	100	\$ 15.84	\$ 1.17	\$ -	\$ 17.01	\$ 1,701.00
				GFS	100	\$ 25.60	\$ 1.25	\$ 8.81	\$ 18.04	\$ 1,804.00
J & J SNACK	7054	Bavarian Bakery WG Gourmet Pretzel Roll 2.7 oz		KOHL	150	\$ 42.88	\$ 1.85	\$ 2.41	\$ 42.32	\$ 6,348.00
				PFG	150	\$ 44.70	\$ 2.37	\$ 2.40	\$ 44.67	\$ 6,700.50
			no bid	GFS	150	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
	74221	Harvest Theme Cookie Dough		KOHL	40	\$ 29.94	\$ 1.85	\$ 0.83	\$ 30.96	\$ 1,238.40
				PFG	40	\$ 31.44	\$ 3.77	\$ 0.83	\$ 34.38	\$ 1,375.20
			no bid	GFS	40	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
	74224	Spring Theme Cookie Dough		KOHL	40	\$ 29.94	\$ 1.85	\$ 0.83	\$ 30.96	\$ 1,238.40
				PFG	40	\$ 31.44	\$ 3.77	\$ 0.83	\$ 34.38	\$ 1,375.20
			no bid	GFS	40	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
	74225	Holiday Theme Cookie Dough		KOHL	40	\$ 29.94	\$ 1.85	\$ 0.83	\$ 30.96	\$ 1,238.40
				PFG	40	\$ 31.44	\$ 3.77	\$ 0.83	\$ 34.38	\$ 1,375.20

											100 \$	22.64 \$	1.25 \$	4.63 \$	19.26 \$	1,926.00 \$
MCCAIN																
	10000004309	Harvest Splendor Savory Sweet Potato Fry														
											35 \$	22.98 \$	1.70 \$	4.63 \$	20.05 \$	701.75 \$
											35 \$	23.10 \$	1.89 \$	4.63 \$	20.36 \$	712.60 \$
											35 \$	21.65 \$	1.25 \$	4.63 \$	18.27 \$	639.45 \$
	MCF04566	Harvest Splendor Deep Groove Sweet Potato									450 \$	21.48 \$	2.44 \$	4.63 \$	19.29 \$	8,680.50 \$
											450 \$	21.60 \$	1.77 \$	4.63 \$	18.74 \$	8,433.00 \$
											450 \$	23.15 \$	1.25 \$	4.63 \$	19.77 \$	8,896.50 \$
	10000006639	Emoticons Crispy Mashed Potato Shapes									425 \$	26.68 \$	1.70 \$	5.05 \$	23.33 \$	9,915.25 \$
											425 \$	26.17 \$	2.09 \$	5.05 \$	23.21 \$	9,864.25 \$
											425 \$	26.95 \$	1.25 \$	5.05 \$	23.15 \$	9,838.75 \$
	OIF03456	Potato Smiles									125 \$	25.23 \$	1.70 \$	6.08 \$	20.85 \$	2,606.25 \$
											125 \$	25.42 \$	3.05 \$	6.08 \$	22.39 \$	2,798.75 \$
											125 \$	25.50 \$	1.25 \$	6.08 \$	20.67 \$	2,583.75 \$
	MXC04717	Reduced Sodium Potato Sticks									150 \$	26.88 \$	1.70 \$	7.60 \$	20.98 \$	3,147.00 \$
											150 \$	27.32 \$	2.46 \$	7.60 \$	22.18 \$	3,327.00 \$
											150 \$	27.22 \$	1.25 \$	7.60 \$	20.87 \$	3,130.50 \$
	MCF03927	Deli Roasters									50 \$	28.08 \$	1.70 \$	7.60 \$	22.18 \$	1,109.00 \$
											50 \$	28.32 \$	2.35 \$	7.60 \$	23.07 \$	1,153.50 \$
											50 \$	28.82 \$	1.25 \$	7.60 \$	22.47 \$	1,123.50 \$
	MCL03623	Redstone Canyon Cross Trax									45 \$	25.14 \$	1.70 \$	6.84 \$	20.00 \$	900.00 \$
											45 \$	25.36 \$	2.11 \$	6.84 \$	20.63 \$	928.35 \$
											45 \$	25.44 \$	1.25 \$	6.84 \$	19.85 \$	893.25 \$
	MCX03626	Redstone Canyon Potato Wedges									425 \$	25.64 \$	1.70 \$	7.60 \$	19.74 \$	8,389.50 \$
											425 \$	24.86 \$	2.06 \$	7.60 \$	19.32 \$	8,211.00 \$
											425 \$	24.96 \$	1.25 \$	7.60 \$	18.61 \$	7,909.25 \$
MICHAELS																
	46025-75014	WG Cinn. Glazed French Toast									300 \$	59.23 \$	2.10 \$	6.26 \$	55.07 \$	16,521.00 \$
											300 \$	59.23 \$	4.15 \$	6.26 \$	57.12 \$	17,136.00 \$
											300 \$	59.23 \$	1.25 \$	6.26 \$	54.22 \$	16,266.00 \$

						425 \$	-	-	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	\$
1260						100 \$	96.54 \$	2.10 \$	47.79 \$	50.85 \$	5,085.00						
						100 \$	96.54 \$	6.76 \$	47.79 \$	55.51 \$	5,551.00						
						100 \$	-	-	-	-	-						
635300						135 \$	55.99 \$	2.10 \$	18.94 \$	39.15 \$	5,285.25						
						135 \$	55.99 \$	3.47 \$	18.94 \$	40.52 \$	5,470.20						
						135 \$	-	-	-	-	-						
110458						50 \$	79.89 \$	2.10 \$	37.88 \$	44.11 \$	2,205.50						
						50 \$	79.89 \$	4.95 \$	37.89 \$	46.95 \$	2,347.50						
						50 \$	79.89 \$	1.25 \$	37.89 \$	43.25 \$	2,162.50						
615300						425 \$	55.99 \$	2.10 \$	18.94 \$	39.15 \$	16,638.75						
						425 \$	55.99 \$	3.47 \$	18.94 \$	40.52 \$	17,221.00						
						425 \$	-	-	-	-	-						
7572						400 \$	76.84 \$	2.10 \$	24.34 \$	54.60 \$	21,840.00						
						400 \$	55.99 \$	3.47 \$	18.94 \$	40.52 \$	16,208.00						
						400 \$	-	-	-	-	-						
7576						30 \$	77.20 \$	2.10 \$	24.70 \$	54.60 \$	1,638.00						
						30 \$	77.20 \$	4.79 \$	24.70 \$	57.29 \$	1,718.70						
						30 \$	-	-	-	-	-						
RED GOLD																	
72940-81907/RPKIL99						300 \$	24.11 \$	1.60 \$	5.06 \$	20.65 \$	6,195.00						
						300 \$	25.43 \$	1.75 \$	5.06 \$	22.12 \$	6,636.00						
						300 \$	21.33 \$	1.25 \$	6.33 \$	16.25 \$	4,875.00						
72940-82200/RPKNA99						225 \$	25.84 \$	1.60 \$	3.10 \$	24.34 \$	5,476.50						
						225 \$	27.52 \$	1.89 \$	3.10 \$	26.31 \$	5,919.75						
						225 \$	27.45 \$	1.25 \$	3.10 \$	25.60 \$	5,760.00						
72940-11005/REDSC99						20 \$	25.59 \$	1.60 \$	2.43 \$	24.76 \$	495.20						
						20 \$	27.27 \$	1.87 \$	2.43 \$	26.71 \$	534.20						
						20 \$	27.20 \$	1.25 \$	2.43 \$	26.02 \$	520.40						

	72580	Tony's 5" Deep Dish Cheese Pizza				50 \$	42.60 \$	1.85 \$	4.80 \$	39.65 \$	1,982.50 \$
						50 \$	51.26 \$	2.72 \$	7.29 \$	46.69 \$	2,334.50 \$
				no bid		50 \$	- \$	- \$	- \$	- \$	- \$
	78359	Tony's French Bread Multi Cheese Pizza				75 \$	45.16 \$	1.85 \$	2.84 \$	44.17 \$	3,312.75 \$
						75 \$	47.45 \$	3.80 \$	2.84 \$	48.41 \$	3,630.75 \$
						75 \$	46.82 \$	1.25 \$	2.84 \$	45.23 \$	3,392.25 \$
SIMPLOT	10071179004189	Tater Gems ZTF				125 \$	22.09 \$	1.70 \$	7.60 \$	16.19 \$	2,023.75 \$
						125 \$	34.71 \$	2.78 \$	7.61 \$	29.88 \$	3,735.00 \$
						125 \$	22.87 \$	1.25 \$	7.61 \$	16.51 \$	2,063.75 \$
	10071179280224	Classic Tritaters ZTF				150 \$	24.17 \$	1.70 \$	7.60 \$	18.27 \$	2,740.50 \$
						150 \$	37.08 \$	3.26 \$	7.61 \$	32.73 \$	4,909.50 \$
				alt to spec 175233 Hash Brown Patty		150 \$	- \$	- \$	- \$	- \$	- \$
	10071179032168	Conquest Sidewinders				100 \$	27.81 \$	1.70 \$	6.08 \$	23.43 \$	2,343.00 \$
						100 \$	29.75 \$	2.23 \$	6.08 \$	25.90 \$	2,590.00 \$
						100 \$	28.45 \$	1.25 \$	6.09 \$	23.61 \$	2,361.00 \$
	10071179470144	Savory Loops				75 \$	27.49 \$	1.70 \$	7.60 \$	21.59 \$	1,619.25 \$
						75 \$	35.01 \$	2.91 \$	7.61 \$	30.31 \$	2,273.25 \$
						75 \$	28.27 \$	1.25 \$	7.61 \$	21.91 \$	1,643.25 \$
SMUCKERS	5150006960	Peanut Butter & Grape Jelly 2.6 oz		DID NOT INC ADD'L ALLOWANCE		200 \$	35.41 \$	1.95 \$	2.02 \$	35.34 \$	7,068.00 \$
						200 \$	35.33 \$	5.30 \$	3.39 \$	37.24 \$	7,448.00 \$
						200 \$	35.83 \$	1.25 \$	3.39 \$	33.69 \$	6,738.00 \$
	5150021027	Peanut Butter and Grape Jelly 5.3 oz		DID NOT INC ADD'L ALLOWANCE		650 \$	64.25 \$	1.95 \$	4.04 \$	62.16 \$	40,404.00 \$
						650 \$	64.10 \$	9.62 \$	5.81 \$	67.91 \$	44,141.50 \$
						650 \$	64.90 \$	1.25 \$	5.81 \$	60.34 \$	39,221.00 \$
	5150021028	Peanut Butter and Strawberry Jelly 5.3 oz		DID NOT INC ADD'L ALLOWANCE		450 \$	67.38 \$	1.95 \$	4.04 \$	65.29 \$	29,380.50 \$
						450 \$	67.23 \$	10.09 \$	8.03 \$	69.29 \$	31,180.50 \$
						450 \$	68.02 \$	1.25 \$	8.03 \$	61.24 \$	27,558.00 \$
SUNNYFRESH	50038	Pillow Pack Hard Cooked Eggs				50 \$	30.52 \$	1.90 \$	10.15 \$	22.27 \$	1,113.50 \$
						50 \$	32.75 \$	2.24 \$	10.15 \$	24.84 \$	1,242.00 \$

