



Serving all or part of:  
 Palatine • Rolling Meadows • Inverness  
 Arlington Heights • Hoffman Estates  
 Schaumburg • South Barrington

## Community Consolidated School District 15

Joseph M. Kiszka Educational Service Center  
 580 N. 1st Bank Drive  
 Palatine, IL 60067-8110

Michael Adamczyk  
 Chief School Business Official

(847) 963-3032 • Fax (847) 963-3061  
 www.ccsd15.net



**DATE:** October 12, 2016  
**TO:** Board of Education  
**FROM:** Linda Styczen  
**RE:** Bid #17-004 Custodial Cleaning Supplies

### Background

Bid specifications for Custodial Cleaning Supplies were published in the Daily Herald Newspaper and posted on the District website on September 8, 2016. Bid instructions were emailed to 17 vendors and we received 15 responses, with one no bid. The purchase is for cleaning supplies to be used at all district facilities.

### Results

Vendor	Paper / Misc	Chemicals	Total Bid Award
<b>Boelter Co.</b> Wood Dale, IL	\$ 602.64	\$ 7,031.70	\$ 7,634.34
<b>Chemcraft</b> Chicago, IL	\$ 13,081.40	\$ 5,094.30	\$ 18,175.70
<b>Metro Professional Products</b> Des Plaines, IL	\$ 24,425.00		\$ 24,425.00
<b>Pyramid School Products</b> Tampa, FL	\$ 1,036.20		\$ 1,036.20
<b>Supply Works</b> Lombard, IL	\$ 110,409.50	\$ 95,406.00	\$ 205,815.50
<b>Unipak Corp.</b> Brooklyn, NY	\$ 30,390.00		\$ 30,390.00
<b>Veritiv</b> Jacksonville, FL	\$ 2,448.00	\$ 2,798.00	\$ 5,246.00
<b>TOTAL SPEND 2016 – 2017</b>			<b>\$292,722.74</b>

### Recommendation

It is recommended that the Board of Education award the custodial cleaning supplies bid to seven companies in the amounts listed above. The total expenditure for Custodial Cleaning Supplies in 2016-2017 is \$292,722.74. Recommendations are based on low bid vendors meeting bid specifications. The expenditure is budgeted in the 2016-2017 Operations and Maintenance Fund Budget.

Bid documents are on file in the business office for review.

**CUSTODIAL CLEANING SUPPLIES - PAPER/MISC**

COMPANY	Black Can Liner, Large 48 Gallon 100/Box, Flat Bottom Sealed	Black Can Liner, Small 26 Gallon 100/Box, Flat Bottom Sealed	Superior "No Trax" 4'x8' Floor Mat Carpet Runners	Superior "No Trax" 3'x6' Floor Mat Carpet Runners	Rubbermaid #FG264000, BRUTE Dolly	Rubbermaid #FG264300, BRUTE Container 44 gal, Gray, no lid	Microfiber Rubbermaid #FGQ55000 YL00 11" Quick Connect Wall/Straight Frame	Microfiber Rubbermaid #FGQ82000 BL00 11" Damp Mop
Unit Measure	Box	Box	Each	Each	Each	Each	Each	Each
Item #	1.	2.	3.	4.	5.	6.	7.	8.
QUANTITY	1500	1000	150	50	60	30	36	120
<b>Boelter Companies</b>	\$ 17.98	\$ 8.55			\$ 32.99	\$ 34.59	\$ 9.75	\$ 5.99
Chicago IL	\$ 26,970.00	\$ 8,550.00	no bid	no bid	\$ 1,979.40	\$ 1,037.70	\$ <b>351.00</b>	\$ 718.80
Central Poly*	\$ 15.20	\$ 7.40						
Linden NJ	\$ 22,800.00	\$ 7,400.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
<b>Chemcraft</b>	\$ 18.95	\$ 9.95	\$ 55.00	\$ 30.95	\$ 37.08	\$ 40.45	\$ 11.72	\$ 7.55
Chicago IL	\$ 28,425.00	\$ 9,950.00	\$ <b>8,250.00</b>	\$ <b>1,547.50</b>	\$ 2,224.80	\$ 1,213.50	\$ 421.92	\$ 906.00
Cougar Packaging Lemont IL	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Dyna Pak Lawrenceburg TN	\$ 20.37 \$ 30,555.00	\$ 9.97 \$ 9,970.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Image Systems Elk Grove IL	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 48.00 \$ 2,880.00	\$ 49.45 \$ 1,483.50	no bid	no bid
Interboro Packaging* Montgomery NY	\$ 14.98 \$ 22,470.00	\$ 7.48 \$ 7,480.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Kranz Inc. Racine WI	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 34.32 \$ 2,059.20	\$ 35.94 \$ 1,078.20	\$ 10.09 \$ 363.24	\$ 6.22 \$ 746.40
<b>Metro Prof. Prods.</b>								
Des Plaines IL	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
North American Corp.** Glenview IL	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 35.34 \$ 2,120.40	\$ 37.95 \$ 1,138.50	\$ 10.66 \$ 383.76	\$ 6.57 \$ 788.40
<b>Pyramid School Prods.**</b>			\$ 57.98	\$ 34.97	\$ 17.27	\$ 25.69	\$ 11.98	\$ 6.74
Tampa FL	no bid	no bid	\$ 8,697.00	\$ 1,748.50	\$ <b>1,036.20</b>	\$ 770.70	\$ 431.28	\$ 808.80
<b>Supplyworks</b>			\$ 57.60	\$ 33.00	\$ 24.85	\$ 25.75	\$ 12.10	\$ 7.50
Lombard IL	no bid	no bid	\$ 8,640.00	\$ 1,650.00	\$ 1,491.00	\$ <b>772.50</b>	\$ 435.60	\$ 900.00
<b>Unipak Corp.</b>	\$ 15.18	\$ 7.62						
Brooklyn NY	\$ <b>22,770.00</b>	\$ <b>7,620.00</b>	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
<b>Veritiv Operating Co.***</b>	\$ 23.32	\$ 13.55			\$ 30.95	\$ 30.52		\$ 5.53
Jacksonville FL	\$ 34,980.00	\$ 13,550.00	no bid	no bid	\$ 1,857.00	\$ 915.60	no bid	\$ <b>663.60</b>

\* Does not meet specifications  
 \*\* No samples provided  
 \*\*\* Unauthorized distributor / invalid pricing

**CUSTODIAL CLEANING SUPPLIES - PAPER/MISC**

<b>COMPANY</b>	<b>Microfiber Rubbermaid #FGQ76500 YL00 4'x8' Quick Connect Extension Pole</b>	<b>Microfiber Rubbermaid #FGQ74500 YL00 Quick Connect Straight Extension Handle</b>	<b>Microfiber Rubbermaid #FGQ56000 YL00 18" Quick Connect Wet/Dry Frame</b>	<b>Microfiber Rubbermaid #FGQ41000 BL00 18" Single Side Damp Mop</b>	<b>Microfiber Rubbermaid #FGQ41000 GR00 18" Single Side Damp Mop</b>	<b>Microfiber Rubbermaid #FGQ41000 BL00 18" Single Side Damp Mop</b>	<b>Cellulose Sponge, Yellow, 3-3/8"x6-1/4"x1"</b>	<b>Cellulose Sponge, Yellow, 1-1/2"x4-1/2"x6"</b>
<i>Unit Measure</i>	<i>Each</i>	<i>Each</i>	<i>Each</i>	<i>Each</i>	<i>Each</i>	<i>Each</i>	<i>Each</i>	<i>Each</i>
<b>Item #</b>	<b>9.</b>	<b>10.</b>	<b>11.</b>	<b>12.</b>	<b>13.</b>	<b>14.</b>	<b>15.</b>	<b>16.</b>
<b>QUANTITY</b>	<b>24</b>	<b>72</b>	<b>48</b>	<b>120</b>	<b>120</b>	<b>120</b>	<b>2,500</b>	<b>3,500</b>
<b>Boelter Companies</b>	\$ 48.98	\$ 6.45	\$ 13.65	\$ 5.90	\$ 5.90	\$ 5.90		
Chicago IL	\$ 1,175.52	\$ 464.40	\$ 655.20	\$ 708.00	\$ 708.00	\$ 708.00	no bid	no bid
<b>Central Poly*</b>								
Linden NJ	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
<b>Chemcraft</b>	\$ 44.80	\$ 7.35	\$ 16.10	\$ 7.49	\$ 7.49	\$ 7.49	\$ 0.88	\$ 1.79
Chicago IL	\$ 1,075.20	\$ 529.20	\$ 772.80	\$ 898.80	\$ 898.80	\$ 898.80	\$ 2,200.00	\$ 6,265.00
<b>Cougar Packaging</b>								
Lemont IL	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
<b>Dyna Pak</b>								
Lawrenceburg TN	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
<b>Image Systems</b>	\$ 65.11	\$ 9.15	\$ 19.60	\$ 8.94	\$ 8.94	\$ 8.94		
Elk Grove IL	\$ 1,562.64	\$ 658.80	\$ 940.80	\$ 1,072.80	\$ 1,072.80	\$ 1,072.80	no bid	no bid
<b>Interboro Packaging*</b>								
Montgomery NY	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
<b>Kranz Inc.</b>	\$ 49.45	\$ 6.68	\$ 14.16	\$ 6.12	\$ 6.12	\$ 6.12		
Racine WI	\$ 1,186.80	\$ 480.96	\$ 679.68	\$ 734.40	\$ 734.40	\$ 734.40	no bid	no bid
<b>Metro Prof. Prods.</b>								
Des Plaines IL	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
<b>North American Corp.**</b>	\$ 53.82	\$ 7.06	\$ 14.02	\$ 6.46	\$ 6.46	\$ 6.46		\$ 1.22
Glenview IL	\$ 1,291.68	\$ 508.32	\$ 672.96	\$ 775.20	\$ 775.20	\$ 775.20	no bid	\$ 4,270.00
<b>Pyramid School Prods.**</b>	\$ 53.89	\$ 6.99	\$ 15.89	\$ 5.99	\$ 5.99	\$ 5.99	\$ 0.71	\$ 1.39
Tampa FL	\$ 1,293.36	\$ 503.28	\$ 762.72	\$ 718.80	\$ 718.80	\$ 718.80	\$ 1,775.00	\$ 4,865.00
<b>Supplyworks</b>	\$ 47.50	\$ 7.70	\$ 16.50	\$ 4.95	\$ 4.95	\$ 4.95	\$ 0.72	\$ 1.60
Lombard IL	\$ 1,140.00	\$ 554.40	\$ 792.00	\$ 594.00	\$ 594.00	\$ 594.00	\$ 1,800.00	\$ 5,600.00
<b>Unipak Corp.</b>								
Brooklyn NY	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
<b>Veritiv Operating Co.***</b>	\$ 33.60	\$ 5.53	\$ 12.08	\$ 5.53	\$ 5.53	\$ 5.53		
Jacksonville FL	\$ 806.40	\$ 398.16	\$ 579.84	\$ 663.60	\$ 663.60	\$ 663.60	no bid	no bid

\* Does not meet specifications  
 \*\* No samples provided  
 \*\*\* Unauthorized distributor / invalid pricing

**CUSTODIAL CLEANING SUPPLIES - PAPER/MISC**

<b>COMPANY</b>	<b>3M #55654 Easy Trap Duster</b>	<b>Sealed Air #3755388 MicroQuick® Microfiber Towel for glass. BLUE 16" x 16"</b>	<b>Sealed Air #3755311 MicroQuick® Microfiber Towel for glass. GREEN 16" x 16"</b>	<b>Sealed Air #3755396 MicroQuick® Microfiber Towel for glass. RED 16" x 16"</b>	<b>Georgia Pacific SofPull Mechanical Hardwound Roll Towel Dispenser, Model 59489</b>	<b>Georgia Pacific SofPull Hardwound Roll Paper Towel, white #26470</b>	<b>Ecosoft Universal Bath Tissue #54000, white</b>	<b>3M #63 White Light Duty Scrub Sponge</b>
<i>Unit Measure</i>	<i>Case</i>	<i>Each</i>	<i>Each</i>	<i>Each</i>	<i>Each</i>	<i>Case</i>	<i>Case</i>	<i>Each</i>
<b>Item #</b>	<b>17.</b>	<b>18.</b>	<b>19.</b>	<b>20.</b>	<b>21a.</b>	<b>21b.</b>	<b>22.</b>	<b>23.</b>
<b>QUANTITY</b>	<b>30</b>	<b>300</b>	<b>300</b>	<b>300</b>	<b>500</b>	<b>2500</b>	<b>700</b>	<b>2000</b>
<b>Boelter Companies</b>	\$ 47.84				\$ 24.23	\$ 39.49		\$ 1.59
Chicago IL	\$ 1,435.20	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 12,115.00	\$ 98,725.00	no bid	\$ 3,180.00
<b>Central Poly*</b>								
Linden NJ	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
<b>Chemcraft</b>	\$ 36.13							\$ 1.10
Chicago IL	\$ <b>1,083.90</b>	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ <b>2,200.00</b>
<b>Cougar Packaging</b>								
Lemont IL	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
<b>Dyna Pak</b>								
Lawrenceburg TN	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
<b>Image Systems</b>	\$ 55.60	\$ 3.01	\$ 3.01	\$ 2.80	\$ 30.82	\$ 56.85	\$ 39.77	\$ 1.96
Elk Grove IL	\$ 1,668.00	\$ 903.00	\$ 903.00	\$ 840.00	\$ 15,410.00	\$ 142,125.00	\$ 27,839.00	\$ 3,920.00
<b>Interboro Packaging*</b>								
Montgomery NY	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
<b>Kranz Inc.</b>	\$ 49.50	\$ 2.49	\$ 2.49	\$ 2.49				\$ 1.72
Racine WI	\$ 1,485.00	\$ 747.00	\$ 747.00	\$ 747.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 3,440.00
<b>Metro Prof. Prods.</b>	\$ 36.16						\$ 29.95	\$ 1.23
Des Plaines IL	\$ 1,084.80	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ <b>20,965.00</b>	\$ 2,460.00
<b>North American Corp.**</b>	\$ 50.23					\$ 42.44	\$ 32.58	\$ 1.79
Glenview IL	\$ 1,506.90	no bid	no bid	no bid	N/C	\$ 106,100.00	\$ 22,806.00	\$ 3,580.00
<b>Pyramid School Prods.**</b>	\$ 50.99							\$ 1.74
Tampa FL	\$ 1,529.70	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 3,480.00
<b>Supplyworks</b>	\$ 44.50	\$ 2.45	\$ 2.45	\$ 2.45		\$ 39.30	\$ 31.35	\$ 1.60
Lombard IL	\$ 1,335.00	\$ <b>735.00</b>	\$ <b>735.00</b>	\$ <b>735.00</b>	N/C	\$ <b>98,250.00</b>	\$ 21,945.00	\$ 3,200.00
<b>Unipak Corp.</b>								
Brooklyn NY	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
<b>Veritiv Operating Co.***</b>		\$ 2.17	\$ 2.17	\$ 2.17				
Jacksonville FL	no bid	\$ 651.00	\$ 651.00	\$ 651.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid

\* Does not meet specifications  
 \*\* No samples provided  
 \*\*\* Unauthorized distributor / invalid pricing

**CUSTODIAL CLEANING SUPPLIES - PAPER/MISC**

<b>COMPANY</b>	<b>Vacuum Cleaner Bags #86000460 Windsor VS14 &amp; VS18</b>	<b>Rubbermaid #FG9C0400 30"-42" Lambswool Duster with Telescoping Plastic Handle</b>	<b>TOTALS</b>
<i>Unit Measure</i>	<i>Package</i>	<i>Each</i>	
<b>Item #</b>	<b>24.</b>	<b>25.</b>	
<b>QUANTITY</b>	<b>400</b>	<b>36</b>	
<b>Boelter Companies</b>		\$ 6.99	
Chicago IL	no bid	\$ 251.64	<b>602.64</b>
Central Poly*			
Linden NJ	no bid	no bid	
<b>Chemcraft</b>		\$ 7.97	
Chicago IL	no bid	\$ 286.92	<b>13,081.40</b>
Cougar Packaging			
Lemont IL	no bid	no bid	
Dyna Pak			
Lawrenceburg TN	no bid	no bid	
Image Systems		\$ 9.56	
Elk Grove IL	no bid	\$ 344.16	
Interboro Packaging*			
Montgomery NY	no bid	no bid	
Kranz Inc.		\$ 7.30	
Racine WI	no bid	\$ 262.80	
<b>Metro Prof. Prods.</b>	\$ 8.65		
Des Plaines IL	\$ 3,460.00	no bid	<b>24,425.00</b>
North American Corp.**		\$ 7.72	
Glenview IL	no bid	\$ 277.92	
<b>Pyramid School Prods.**</b>		\$ 7.59	
Tampa FL	no bid	\$ 273.24	<b>1,036.20</b>
<b>Supplyworks</b>	\$ 10.50	\$ 7.70	
Lombard IL	\$ 4,200.00	\$ 277.20	<b>110,409.50</b>
<b>Unipak Corp.</b>			
Brooklyn NY	no bid	no bid	<b>30,390.00</b>
<b>Veritiv Operating Co.***</b>		\$ 7.35	
Jacksonville FL	no bid	\$ 264.60	<b>2,448.00</b>
* Does not meet specifications ** No samples provided *** Unauthorized distributor / invalid pricing			

**CUSTODIAL CLEANING SUPPLIES - CHEMICALS**

<b>COMPANY</b>	<b>Acid (9% or more) Bowl Cleaner</b>	<b>Non-Acid Bowl Cleaner &amp; Disinfectant 12 Qts/CS</b>	<b>Spartan Consume (or Equal) Odor Enzyme</b>	<b>Sealed Air Virex II 256 Disinfectant #5271416 2/CS</b>	<b>Sealed Air #32 Speedball 2000 Heavy Duty Cleaner #5893063</b>	<b>Sealed Air #50 Raindance Low Foam Neutral Floor Cleaner #3323981</b>	<b>Sealed Air Carpet Shampoo, #5002689</b>	<b>PDI® Sani-Cloth® Plus Disinfectant Wipes Q10584</b>
<i>Unit Measure</i>	<i>Case</i>	<i>Case</i>	<i>Case</i>	<i>Case</i>	<i>Case</i>	<i>Case</i>	<i>Case</i>	<i>Each</i>
<b>QUANTITY</b>	<b>25</b>	<b>150</b>	<b>100</b>	<b>150</b>	<b>50</b>	<b>50</b>	<b>30</b>	<b>750</b>
<b>Boelter Companies</b>								
Chicago IL	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Central Poly Linden NJ	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
<b>Chemcraft</b>	\$ 17.20		\$ 27.88					\$ 5.25
Chicago IL	\$ 430.00	no bid	\$ 2,788.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ <b>3,937.50</b>
Cougar Packaging Lemont IL	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Dyna Pak Lawrenceburg TN	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Image Systems*** Elk Grove IL	\$ 26.67 \$ 666.75	no bid	no bid	\$ 20.70 \$ 3,105.00	\$ 8.68 \$ 434.00	no bid	\$ 67.00 \$ 2,010.00	\$ 9.30 \$ 6,975.00
Interboro Packaging Montgomery NY	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Kranz Inc. Racine WI	\$ 16.20 \$ 405.00	\$ 17.70 \$ 2,655.00	\$ 27.90 \$ 2,790.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Metro Prof. Prods. Des Plaines IL	\$ 15.75 \$ 393.75	\$ 16.72 \$ 2,508.00	\$ 25.40 \$ 2,540.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
North American Corp. Glenview IL	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Pyramid School Prods. Tampa FL	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 7.20 \$ 5,400.00
<b>Supplyworks</b>	\$ 18.50	\$ 19.25	\$ 19.35	\$ 85.00	\$ 109.00	\$ 97.00	\$ 59.50	\$ 9.25
Lombard IL	\$ 462.50	\$ 2,887.50	\$ <b>1,935.00</b>	\$ <b>12,750.00</b>	\$ <b>5,450.00</b>	\$ <b>4,850.00</b>	\$ <b>1,785.00</b>	\$ 6,937.50
Unipak Corp. Brooklyn NY	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
<b>Veritiv Operating Co.***</b>	\$ 15.44	\$ 16.08	\$ 23.16	\$ 77.43	\$ 101.91	\$ 92.36	\$ 47.98	
Jacksonville FL	\$ <b>386.00</b>	\$ <b>2,412.00</b>	\$ 2,316.00	\$ 11,614.50	\$ 5,095.50	\$ 4,618.00	\$ 1,439.40	no bid

\* Does not meet specifications  
 \*\* No samples provided  
 \*\*\* Unauthorized distributor / invalid pricing

**CUSTODIAL CLEANING SUPPLIES - CHEMICALS**

<b>COMPANY</b>	<b>Motsenbocker's Lift Off #1 Stain Remover</b>	<b>Sealed Air Vectra Floor Finish #5105047</b>	<b>GoJo Hand Sanitizer Foam, #GOJ8804-03- ADX refill + 400 #GOJ8820- 06-ADX Dispensers</b>	<b>GoJo® Green Seal Foam Hand Soap #5165-03</b>	<b>GoJo® Soap Dispenser (black) #5155- 06</b>	<b>Sealed Air Recoat Adhesion Formula &amp; Tacking Solution #5142243</b>	<b>Sealed Air Ultra Low Odor Waterbased Finish #5142227</b>
<i>Unit Measure</i>	<i>Case</i>	<i>Box</i>	<i>Case</i>	<i>Case</i>	<i>Each</i>	<i>Pail</i>	<i>Pail</i>
<b>QUANTITY</b>	<b>30</b>	<b>150</b>	<b>130</b>	<b>1500</b>	<b>400</b>	<b>10</b>	<b>56</b>
<b>Boelter Companies</b>			\$ 54.09	\$ 34.88			
Chicago IL	no bid	no bid	\$ <b>7,031.70</b>	\$ 52,320.00	N/C	no bid	no bid
Central Poly Linden NJ	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
<b>Chemcraft</b>	\$ 38.56		\$ 54.68	\$ 34.92			
Chicago IL	\$ <b>1,156.80</b>	no bid	\$ 7,108.40	\$ 52,380.00	N/C	no bid	no bid
Cougar Packaging Lemont IL	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Dyna Pak Lawrenceburg TN	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Image Systems***	\$ 46.52	\$ 79.95		\$ 41.30	\$ 12.60		
Elk Grove IL	\$ 1,395.60	\$ 11,992.50	no bid	\$ 61,950.00	\$ 5,040.00	no bid	no bid
Interboro Packaging Montgomery NY	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Kranz Inc. Racine WI	\$ 55.05						
	\$ 1,651.50	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Metro Prof. Prods. Des Plaines IL	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
North American Corp. Glenview IL	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Pyramid School Prods. Tampa FL	\$ 41.84			\$ 45.99	\$ 15.98		
	\$ 1,255.20	no bid	no bid	\$ 68,985.00	\$ 6,392.00	no bid	no bid
<b>Supplyworks</b>	\$ 52.65	\$ 56.90	\$ 54.90	\$ 28.95		\$ 129.00	\$ 235.00
Lombard IL	\$ 1,579.50	\$ <b>8,535.00</b>	\$ 7,137.00	\$ <b>43,425.00</b>	<b>N/C</b>	\$ <b>1,290.00</b>	\$ <b>13,160.00</b>
Unipak Corp. Brooklyn NY	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
<b>Veritiv Operating Co.***</b>		\$ 56.85	\$ 57.03	\$ 36.77		\$ 122.18	\$ 219.29
Jacksonville FL	no bid	\$ 8,527.50	\$ 7,413.90	\$ 55,155.00	N/C	\$ 1,221.80	\$ 12,280.24
* Does not meet specifications							
** No samples provided							
*** Unauthorized distributor / invalid pricing							

**CUSTODIAL CLEANING SUPPLIES - CHEMICALS**

COMPANY	Sealed Air Waterborne Finish Crosslinker #5142235	TOTALS
<i>Unit Measure</i>	<i>Pail</i>	
<b>QUANTITY</b>	<b>56</b>	
<b>Boelter Companies</b>		
Chicago IL	no bid	<b>7,031.70</b>
Central Poly Linden NJ	no bid	
<b>Chemcraft</b>		
Chicago IL	no bid	<b>5,094.30</b>
Cougar Packaging Lemont IL	no bid	
Dyna Pak Lawrenceburg TN	no bid	
Image Systems*** Elk Grove IL	no bid	
Interboro Packaging Montgomery NY	no bid	
Kranz Inc. Racine WI	no bid	
Metro Prof. Prods. Des Plaines IL	no bid	
North American Corp. Glenview IL	no bid	
Pyramid School Prods. Tampa FL	no bid	
<b>Supplyworks</b>	\$ 39.75	
Lombard IL	\$ <b>2,226.00</b>	<b>95,406.00</b>
Unipak Corp. Brooklyn NY	no bid	
<b>Veritiv Operating Co.***</b>	\$ 36.55	
Jacksonville FL	\$ 2,046.80	<b>2,798.00</b>
* Does not meet specifications ** No samples provided *** Unauthorized distributor / invalid pricing		



**CUSTODIAL CLEANING SUPPLIES - PAPER/MISC**

<b>CO.</b>	<b>Paper/Misc</b>	<b>Chemicals</b>	<b>TOTAL</b>
Boelter	\$ 602.64	\$ 7,031.70	\$ 7,634.34
Chemcraft	\$ 13,081.40	\$ 5,094.30	\$ 18,175.70
Metro	\$ 24,425.00		\$ 24,425.00
Pyramid	\$ 1,036.20		\$ 1,036.20
Supplyworks	\$ 110,409.50	\$ 95,406.00	\$ 205,815.50
Unipak	\$ 30,390.00		\$ 30,390.00
Veritiv	\$ 2,448.00	\$ 2,798.00	\$ 5,246.00
<b>TOTALS:</b>	\$ 182,392.74	\$ 110,330.00	\$ 292,722.74