



Serving all or part of:
Palatine • Rolling Meadows • Inverness
Arlington Heights • Hoffman Estates
Schaumburg • South Barrington

Community Consolidated School District 15

Joseph M. Kiszka Educational Service Center
580 N. 1st Bank Drive
Palatine, IL 60067-8110

Michael Adamczyk
Chief School Business Official

(847) 963-3032 • Fax (847) 963-3061
www.ccsd15.net



To: Board of Education

From: Michael Adamczyk, CSBO
Ivy Fleming, Budget & Purchasing Coordinator

Date: January 5, 2017

Subject: Bid #17-006 School Buses with Optional DVR Cameras

Background

Bid Notice #17-006 School Buses with Optional DVR Cameras was published in the Daily Herald on December 6, 2016. On December 7, 2016, bid specifications were sent to three vendors. Three bids were received back.

Midwest Transit (apparent low bidder) submitted an alternate bid for the 2016 USED PASSENGER BUS. After reviewing the bid documents, the alternate does not meet our preferred specifications.

At this time, we will not be purchasing any of the optional DVR Cameras.

Results

Bid results are attached for Board of Education review.

Recommendation

It is recommended that the Board of Education award the purchase of ten (10) 2016 used 71 passenger buses to Midwest Transit in the amount of \$654,070.00 and one (1) 2018 new wheelchair lift bus to Midwest Bus Sales in the amount of \$95,888.00 for a total bid award of \$749,958.00

The recommendation is based on the most efficient purchase price and yearly maintenance cost while maintaining the same style/model buses to enhance student and driver safety and operational continuity for drivers. The recommendation is based on bid meeting preferred specifications.

These expenditures will be from the 2017-18 Transportation Fund budget.

Bid documents are on file in the Business Office for review.

#17-006 School Buses with Optional DVR Cameras

BID SUMMARY

		2018 NEW 71 PASSENGER BUS QTY- (10)					
VENDOR	QTY.	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE EXTENDED WARRANTY	EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED WARRANTY	TRADE IN VALUE	TOTAL BID
MIDWEST TRANSIT	10	84,436.00	844,360.00	2,300.00	23,000.00	(39,000.00)	828,360.00
CENTRAL STATES	10	89,061.00	890,610.00	2,585.00	25,850.00	(55,000.00)	861,460.00
MIDWEST BUS SALES	10	86,725.00	867,250.00	968.00	9,680.00	(50,000.00)	826,930.00
		2018 NEW 71 PASSENGER BUS QTY- (10) ALTERNATE #1					
VENDOR	QTY.	UNIT PRICE ALTERNATE #1	EXTENDED PRICE ALTERNATE #1	UNIT PRICE EXTENDED WARRANTY	EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED WARRANTY	TRADE IN VALUE	TOTAL BID ALTERNATE #1
MIDWEST TRANSIT	10	83,897.00	838,970.00	2,300.00	23,000.00	(39,000.00)	822,970.00
		2017 USED 71 PASSENGER BUS QTY-(10)					
VENDOR	QTY.	UNIT PRICE 2017 USED 71 PASSENGER BUS	PRICE 2017 USED 71 PASSENGER BUS	UNIT PRICE EXTENDED WARRANTY	EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED WARRANTY	TRADE IN VALUE	TOTAL BID
MIDWEST TRANSIT	10	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
CENTRAL STATES	10	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
MIDWEST BUS SALES	10	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
		2017 USED 71 PASSENGER BUS QTY-(10) ALTERNATE #1					
VENDOR	QTY.	UNIT PRICE ALTERNATE #1	EXTENDED PRICE ALTERNATE #1	UNIT PRICE EXTENDED WARRANTY	EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED WARRANTY	TRADE IN VALUE	TOTAL BID
MIDWEST TRANSIT	10	76,329.00	763,290.00	24 MONTH REMAINING		(39,000.00)	724,290.00
		2016 USED 71 PASSENGER BUS QTY-(10)					
VENDOR	QTY.	2016 USED 71 PASSENGER BUS	PRICE 2016 USED 71 PASSENGER	UNIT PRICE EXTENDED WARRANTY	PRICE EXTENDED WARRANTY	TRADE IN VALUE	TOTAL BID
MIDWEST TRANSIT	10	69,307.00	693,070.00	12 MONTHS REMAINING		(39,000.00)	654,070.00
CENTRAL STATES	10	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
MIDWEST BUS SALES	10	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
		2016 USED 71 PASSENGER BUS QTY-(10) ALTERNATE #1					
VENDOR	QTY.	UNIT PRICE ALTERNATE #1	EXTENDED PRICE ALTERNATE #1	UNIT PRICE EXTENDED WARRANTY	EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED WARRANTY	TRADE IN VALUE	TOTAL BID
MIDWEST TRANSIT	10	68,516.00	685,160.00	12 MONTHS REMAINING		(39,000.00)	646,160.00*
		2017 OR 18 NEW WHEELCHAIR LIFT BUS QTY- (1)					
VENDOR	QTY.	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE EXTENDED WARRANTY	EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED WARRANTY	TRADE IN VALUE	TOTAL BID
MIDWEST TRANSIT	1	97,628.00	97,268.00	2,300.00	2,300.00	-	99,568.00
CENTRAL STATE	1	103,922.00	103,922.00	2,585.00	2,585.00	-	106,507.00
MIDWEST BUS SALES	1	94,920.00	94,920.00	968.00	968.00	-	95,888.00

*DOESN'T MEED PREFERRED SPECIFICATIONS