

June 6, 2018



Serving all or part of:  
 Palatine • Rolling Meadows • Inverness  
 Arlington Heights • Hoffman Estates  
 Schaumburg • South Barrington

## Community Consolidated School District 15

Joseph M. Kiszka Educational Service Center  
 580 N. 1st Bank Drive  
 Palatine, IL 60067-8110

Michael Adamczyk  
 Chief School Business Official

(847) 963-3032 • Fax (847) 963-3061  
 www.ccsd15.net

**To:** Board of Education

**From:** Michael Adamczyk, CSBO  
 Ivy Fleming, Budget & Purchasing Coordinator

**Date:** June 6, 2018

**Subject:** Action Item – Bid #18-027 Custodial Cleaning Equipment



### **Background**

Bid specifications for Custodial Cleaning Equipment were published in the Daily Herald newspaper and posted to the District's website on May 9, 2018. Bid were sent to eight vendors. Three bids were received back.

The purchase will be used for equipment replacement at various District schools.

### **Results**

Please see attached bid award summary.

### **Recommendation**

It is recommended that the Board of Education award the custodial cleaning equipment bid to two companies, SupplyWorks, Lombard, IL at a cost of \$41,101.26 and Warehouse Direct, Des Plaines, IL at a cost of \$27,405.84, for a total contract amount of \$68,507.10. Recommendations are based on low bid vendors meeting bid specifications. The expenditure is budgeted in the Operations and Maintenance Fund for 2018-2019.

Bid documents are on file in the business office for review.

Community Consolidated School District 15

CUSTODIAL CLEANING EQUIPMENT BID #18-027

June 6, 2018

Vendors	Windsor Model VS18 18" Upright Vacuum		Windsor Commodore 20 Extractor, Model CMD20		Nilfisk Advance Wet Dry Vacuum Model VL500-75 Model 56384676		Clarke Focus II Mid-size Autoscrubber Boost 28		Windsor Mini Pro Carpet Extractor Model MPRO		Clarke Orbital Floor Machine 20" Model FM-40LX		Windsor AM3 Portable Air Mover or Equal		TOTAL BID AWARD	
ITEM NO.	1.		2.		3.		4.		5.		6.		7.			
Quantity:	Unit Cost	20	Unit Cost	2	Unit Cost	3	Unit Cost	2	Unit Cost	6	Unit Cost	4	Unit Cost	12		
Kranz Inc. Racine WI	No Bid		No Bid		\$870.53	\$2,611.59	\$10,105.51	\$20,211.02	No Bid		\$2,919.09	\$11,676.36	No Bid			
Supplyworks Lombard IL	\$715.80	\$14,316.00	\$6,825.00	\$13,650.00	\$825.00	\$2,475.00	\$9,870.00	\$19,740.00	\$1,376.47	\$8,258.82	\$2,450.00	\$9,800.00	\$200.12	\$2,401.44	\$41,101.26	
Warehouse Direct Des Plaines IL	\$999.00	\$19,980.00	\$10,055.00	\$20,110.00	No Bid		\$9,354.08	\$18,708.16	No Bid		\$2,174.42	\$8,697.68	\$292.00	\$3,504.00	\$27,405.84	
TOTAL:														\$ 68,507.10		