

**BID #16-003 Custodial Cleaning Supplies**

**Background**

Bid specifications for Custodial Cleaning Supplies were published in the Daily Herald Newspaper and posted on the District website on September 3, 2015. Bid instructions were emailed to 24 vendors and we received 19 responses. The purchase is for cleaning supplies to be used at all district facilities.

**Results**

Vendor	Paper / Misc	Chemicals	Total Bid Award
<b>Boelter Co.</b> Wood Dale, IL	\$ 2,586.30		\$ 2,586.30
<b>Chemcraft</b> Chicago, IL	\$ 793.20	\$ 371.75	\$ 1,164.95
<b>Metro Professional Products</b> Des Plaines, IL	\$ 22,972.00	\$ 2,589.00	\$ 25,561.00
<b>North American Corp.</b> Glenview, IL	\$ 7,104.00		\$ 7,104.00
<b>Pyramid School Products</b> Tampa, FL		\$ 2,477.40	\$ 2,477.40
<b>Supply Works</b> Lombard, IL	\$ 101,847.75	\$ 114,491.50	\$ 216,339.25
<b>Unipak Corp.</b> Brooklyn, NY	\$ 31,300.00		\$ 31,300.00
<b>TOTAL SPEND 2015 – 2016</b>	<b>\$ 166,603.25</b>	<b>\$ 119,929.65</b>	<b>\$ 286,532.90</b>

**Recommendation**

It is recommended that the Board of Education award the custodial cleaning supplies bid to seven companies in the amounts listed above. The total expenditure for Custodial Cleaning Supplies in 2015-2016 is \$286,532.90. Recommendations are based on low bid vendors meeting bid specifications. The expenditure is budgeted in the 2015-2016 Operations and Maintenance Fund Budget.

Bid documents are on file in the business office for review.

**CUSTODIAL CLEANING SUPPLIES - PAPER/MISC**

<b>COMPANY</b>	<b>Black Can Liner, Large 48 Gallon 100/Box, Flat Bottom Sealed</b>	<b>Black Can Liner, Small 26 Gallon 100/Box, Flat Bottom Sealed</b>	<b>Rubbermaid #FG264000, BRUTE Dolly</b>	<b>Rubbermaid #FG264300, BRUTE Container 44 gal, Gray, no lid</b>	<b>Rubbermaid #FG264600, BRUTE Tandem Dolly</b>	<b>Rubbermaid #FG264300, BRUTE Container 44 gal, Blue, no lid</b>	<b>Microfiber Rubbermaid #FGQ55000 YL00 11" Quick Connect Wall/Straight Frame</b>	<b>Microfiber Rubbermaid #FGQ82000 BL00 11" Damp Mop</b>	<b>Microfiber Rubbermaid #FGQ76500 YL00 4'x8' Quick Connect Extension Pole</b>	<b>Microfiber Rubbermaid #FGQ74500 YL00 Quick Connect Straight Extension Handle</b>	<b>Microfiber Rubbermaid #FGQ56000 YL00 18" Quick Connect Wet/Dry Frame</b>	<b>Microfiber Rubbermaid #FGQ41600 BL00 18" High Absorbency Damp Mop</b>
<i>Unit Measure</i>	<i>Box</i>	<i>Box</i>	<i>Each</i>	<i>Each</i>	<i>Each</i>	<i>Each</i>	<i>Each</i>	<i>Each</i>	<i>Each</i>	<i>Each</i>	<i>Each</i>	<i>Each</i>
<i>Item #</i>	<b>1.</b>	<b>2.</b>	<b>3.</b>	<b>4.</b>	<b>5.</b>	<b>6.</b>	<b>7.</b>	<b>8.</b>	<b>9.</b>	<b>10.</b>	<b>11.</b>	<b>12.</b>
<i>QUANTITY</i>	<b>1500</b>	<b>1000</b>	<b>30</b>	<b>30</b>	<b>60</b>	<b>60</b>	<b>36</b>	<b>120</b>	<b>24</b>	<b>72</b>	<b>48</b>	<b>120</b>
All American Poly	\$ 14.93	\$ 8.04										
Piscataway NJ	\$ 22,395.00	\$ 8,040.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Boelter Companies			\$ 17.29	\$ 25.85	\$ 107.35	\$ 25.75	\$ 12.59	\$ 7.89	\$ 48.14	\$ 12.75	\$ 16.69	\$ 8.37
Wood Dale IL	no bid	no bid	\$ 518.70	\$ 775.50	\$ 6,441.00	\$ 1,545.00	\$ 453.24	\$ 946.80	\$ 1,155.36	\$ 918.00	\$ 801.12	\$ 502.20
Calico Industries	\$ 15.44	\$ 7.94	\$ 18.94	\$ 25.74	\$ 108.14	\$ 29.94	\$ 12.24	\$ 8.94	\$ 54.48	\$ 8.95	\$ 16.54	\$ 9.74
Annapolis Junction MO	\$ 23,160.00	\$ 7,940.00	\$ 568.20	\$ 772.20	\$ 6,488.40	\$ 1,796.40	\$ 440.64	\$ 1,072.80	\$ 1,307.52	\$ 644.40	\$ 793.92	\$ 1,168.80
CCP Industries	\$ 17.95	\$ 8.83	\$ 49.80	\$ 47.65	\$ 149.85	\$ 53.25	\$ 15.50	\$ 9.75	\$ 60.72	\$ 9.50	\$ 16.90	
Island Lake IL	\$ 26,925.00	\$ 8,830.00	\$ 1,494.00	\$ 1,429.50	\$ 8,991.00	\$ 3,195.00	\$ 558.00	\$ 1,170.00	\$ 1,457.28	\$ 684.00	\$ 811.20	no bid
Central Poly	\$ 15.50	\$ 7.99										
Linden NJ	\$ 23,250.00	\$ 7,990.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Chemcraft	\$ 18.54	\$ 9.39	\$ 17.39	\$ 25.85	\$ 107.36	\$ 25.78	\$ 12.61	\$ 7.91	\$ 48.20	\$ 7.92	\$ 16.68	\$ 8.37
Chicago IL	\$ 27,810.00	\$ 9,390.00	\$ 521.70	\$ 775.50	\$ 6,441.60	\$ 1,546.80	\$ 453.96	\$ 949.20	\$ 1,156.80	\$ 570.24	\$ 800.64	\$ 502.20
Dispose N Save	\$ 16.90	\$ 8.68										
Monroe NY	\$ 25,350.00	\$ 8,680.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Dyna Pak	\$ 18.98	\$ 8.98										
Lawrenceburg TN	\$ 28,470.00	\$ 8,980.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
e Poly Star Inc.	\$ 19.05	\$ 9.62										
Tampa FL	\$ 28,575.00	\$ 9,620.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Image Systems												
Elk Grove IL	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Interboro Packaging	\$ 15.90	\$ 7.98										
Montgomery NY	\$ 23,850.00	\$ 7,980.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Kranz Inc.			\$ 18.34	\$ 27.17	\$ 113.43	\$ 27.20	\$ 13.31	\$ 8.34	\$ 50.86	\$ 8.34	\$ 17.60	\$ 8.82
Racine WI	no bid	no bid	\$ 550.20	\$ 815.10	\$ 6,805.80	\$ 1,632.00	\$ 479.16	\$ 1,000.80	\$ 1,220.64	\$ 600.48	\$ 844.80	\$ 1,058.40
Metro Prof. Prods.												
Des Plaines IL	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid

**CUSTODIAL CLEANING SUPPLIES - PAPER/MISC**

COMPANY	Black Can Liner, Large 48 Gallon 100/Box, Flat Bottom Sealed	Black Can Liner, Small 26 Gallon 100/Box, Flat Bottom Sealed	Rubbermaid #FG264000, BRUTE Dolly	Rubbermaid #FG264300, BRUTE Container 44 gal, Gray, no lid	Rubbermaid #FG264600, BRUTE Tandem Dolly	Rubbermaid #FG264300, BRUTE Container 44 gal, Blue, no lid	Microfiber Rubbermaid #FGQ55000 YL00 11" Quick Connect Wall/Straight Frame	Microfiber Rubbermaid #FGQ76500 YL00 4'x8' Quick Connect Extension Pole	Microfiber Rubbermaid #FGQ74500 YL00 Quick Connect Straight Extension Handle	Microfiber Rubbermaid #FGQ56000 YL00 18" Quick Connect Wet/Dry Frame	Microfiber Rubbermaid #FGQ41600 BL00 18" High Absorbency Damp Mop	
Unit Measure	Box	Box	Each	Each	Each	Each	Each	Each	Each	Each	Each	Each
Item #	1.	2.	3.	4.	5.	6.	7.	8.	9.	10.	11.	12.
QUANTITY	1500	1000	30	30	60	60	36	120	24	72	48	120
North American Corp.	\$ 19.37	\$ 9.06	\$ 17.76	\$ 26.42	\$ 109.85	\$ 26.35	\$ 12.89	\$ 8.08	\$ 49.26	\$ 8.09	\$ 17.05	\$ 8.55
Glenview IL	\$ 29,055.00	\$ 9,060.00	\$ 532.80	\$ 792.60	\$ 6,591.00	\$ 1,581.00	\$ 464.04	\$ 969.60	\$ 1,182.24	\$ 582.48	\$ 818.40	\$ 1,026.00
Pyramid School Prods.			\$ 17.47	\$ 25.92	\$ 107.45	\$ 25.91	\$ 12.60	\$ 7.92	\$ 48.20	\$ 12.75	\$ 16.69	\$ 8.38
Tampa FL	no bid	no bid	\$ 524.10	\$ 777.60	\$ 6,447.00	\$ 1,554.60	\$ 453.60	\$ 950.40	\$ 1,156.80	\$ 918.00	\$ 801.12	\$ 1,005.60
Standard Companies	\$ 21.09	\$ 10.05	\$ 19.88	\$ 29.48	\$ 122.92	\$ 29.56	\$ 14.43	\$ 9.05	\$ 55.12	\$ 9.06	\$ 19.08	\$ 9.58
Chicago IL	\$ 31,635.00	\$ 10,050.00	\$ 596.40	\$ 884.40	\$ 7,375.20	\$ 1,773.60	\$ 519.48	\$ 1,086.00	\$ 1,322.88	\$ 652.32	\$ 915.84	\$ 1,149.60
Supplyworks	\$ 18.40	\$ 8.68	\$ 24.85	\$ 24.85	\$ 82.90	\$ 24.85	\$ 9.85	\$ 6.75	\$ 43.90	\$ 6.25	\$ 11.95	\$ 10.45
Lombard IL	\$ 27,600.00	\$ 8,680.00	\$ 745.50	\$ 745.50	\$ 4,974.00	\$ 1,491.00	\$ 354.60	\$ 810.00	\$ 1,053.60	\$ 450.00	\$ 573.60	\$ 1,254.00
Unipak Corp.	\$ 15.62	\$ 7.87										
Brooklyn NY	\$ 23,430.00	\$ 7,870.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Valdes	\$ 17.95	\$ 8.95										
Northbrook IL	\$ 26,925.00	\$ 8,950.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid

**CUSTODIAL CLEANING SUPPLIES - PAPER/MISC**

<b>COMPANY</b>	<b>Microfiber Rubbermaid #FGQ41800 GL00 18" Fringed Dust Mop</b>	<b>Microfiber Rubbermaid #FGQ41000 BL00 18" Single Side Damp Mop</b>	<b>Microfiber Rubbermaid #FGQ41000 GR00 18" Single Side Damp Mop</b>	<b>Microfiber Rubbermaid #FGQ41000 RD00 18" Single Side Damp Mop</b>	<b>Microfiber Rubbermaid #FGQ41100 BL00 24" Single Side Damp Room Mop Plus</b>	<b>3M 4100 White Polishing Pad 14" x 32", 10/Case</b>	<b>3M 4100 White Polishing Pad 14" x 28", 10/Case</b>	<b>3M 4100 White Polishing Pad 14" x 20", 10/Case</b>	<b>3M #55654 Easy Trap Duster</b>	<b>Sealed Air #3755388 MicroQuick® Microfiber Towel for glass. BLUE 16" x 16"</b>	<b>Sealed Air #3755311 MicroQuick® Microfiber Towel for glass. GREEN 16" x 16"</b>	<b>Sealed Air #3755396 MicroQuick® Microfiber Towel for glass. RED 16" x 16"</b>
<b>Unit Measure</b>	<i>Each</i>	<i>Each</i>	<i>Each</i>	<i>Each</i>	<i>Each</i>	<i>Case</i>	<i>Case</i>	<i>Case</i>	<i>Box</i>	<i>Each</i>	<i>Each</i>	<i>Each</i>
<b>Item #</b>	<b>13.</b>	<b>14.</b>	<b>15.</b>	<b>16.</b>	<b>17.</b>	<b>18.</b>	<b>19.</b>	<b>20.</b>	<b>21.</b>	<b>22.</b>	<b>23.</b>	<b>24.</b>
<b>QUANTITY</b>	<b>120</b>	<b>120</b>	<b>120</b>	<b>120</b>	<b>120</b>	<b>15</b>	<b>20</b>	<b>32</b>	<b>60</b>	<b>600</b>	<b>600</b>	<b>600</b>
All American Poly												
Piscataway NJ	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Boelter Companies	\$ 4.85	\$ 3.54	\$ 3.54	\$ 3.54	\$ 11.99							
Wood Dale IL	\$ 291.00	\$ 424.80	\$ 424.80	\$ 424.80	\$ 1,438.80	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Calico Industries	\$ 5.64	\$ 4.18	\$ 4.18	\$ 4.18	\$ 13.74							
Annapolis Junction MO	\$ 676.80	\$ 501.60	\$ 501.60	\$ 501.60	\$ 1,648.80	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
CCP Industries	\$ 13.50	\$ 9.30	\$ 9.40	\$ 9.40	\$ 15.90	\$ 164.25	\$ 161.42	\$ 137.20	\$ 62.00			
Island Lake IL	\$ 1,620.00	\$ 1,116.00	\$ 1,128.00	\$ 1,128.00	\$ 1,908.00	\$ 2,463.75	\$ 3,228.40	\$ 4,390.40	\$ 3,720.00	no bid	no bid	no bid
Central Poly												
Linden NJ	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Chemcraft	\$ 4.85	\$ 3.59	\$ 3.59	\$ 3.59	\$ 12.12	\$ 63.55	\$ 55.60	\$ 49.10	\$ 46.90			
Chicago IL	\$ 291.00	\$ 430.80	\$ 430.80	\$ 430.80	\$ 1,454.40	\$ 953.25	\$ 1,112.00	\$ 1,571.20	\$ 2,814.00	no bid	no bid	no bid
Dispose N Save												
Monroe NY	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Dyna Pak												
Lawrenceburg TN	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
e Poly Star Inc.												
Tampa FL	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Image Systems												
Elk Grove IL	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Interboro Packaging												
Montgomery NY	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Kranz Inc.	\$ 5.10	\$ 3.77	\$ 3.77	\$ 3.77	\$ 12.76				\$ 49.50	\$ 2.47	\$ 2.47	\$ 2.47
Racine WI	\$ 612.00	\$ 452.40	\$ 452.40	\$ 452.40	\$ 1,531.20	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 2,970.00	\$ 1,482.00	\$ 1,482.00	\$ 1,482.00
Metro Prof. Prods.												
Des Plaines IL	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid

**CUSTODIAL CLEANING SUPPLIES - PAPER/MISC**

<b>COMPANY</b>	<b>Microfiber Rubbermaid #FGQ41800 GL00 18" Fringed Dust Mop</b>	<b>Microfiber Rubbermaid #FGQ41000 BL00 18" Single Side Damp Mop</b>	<b>Microfiber Rubbermaid #FGQ41000 GR00 18" Single Side Damp Mop</b>	<b>Microfiber Rubbermaid #FGQ41000 RD00 18" Single Side Damp Mop</b>	<b>Microfiber Rubbermaid #FGQ41100 BL00 24" Single Side Damp Room Mop Plus</b>	<b>3M 4100 White Polishing Pad 14" x 32", 10/Case</b>	<b>3M 4100 White Polishing Pad 14" x 28", 10/Case</b>	<b>3M 4100 White Polishing Pad 14" x 20", 10/Case</b>	<b>3M #55654 Easy Trap Duster</b>	<b>Sealed Air #3755388 MicroQuick® Microfiber Towel for glass. BLUE 16" x 16"</b>	<b>Sealed Air #3755311 MicroQuick® Microfiber Towel for glass. GREEN 16" x 16"</b>	<b>Sealed Air #3755396 MicroQuick® Microfiber Towel for glass. RED 16" x 16"</b>
<i>Unit Measure</i>	<i>Each</i>	<i>Each</i>	<i>Each</i>	<i>Each</i>	<i>Each</i>	<i>Case</i>	<i>Case</i>	<i>Case</i>	<i>Box</i>	<i>Each</i>	<i>Each</i>	<i>Each</i>
<b>Item #</b>	<b>13.</b>	<b>14.</b>	<b>15.</b>	<b>16.</b>	<b>17.</b>	<b>18.</b>	<b>19.</b>	<b>20.</b>	<b>21.</b>	<b>22.</b>	<b>23.</b>	<b>24.</b>
<b>QUANTITY</b>	<b>120</b>	<b>120</b>	<b>120</b>	<b>120</b>	<b>120</b>	<b>15</b>	<b>20</b>	<b>32</b>	<b>60</b>	<b>600</b>	<b>600</b>	<b>600</b>
North American Corp.	\$ 4.95	\$ 3.66	\$ 3.66	\$ 3.66	\$ 12.38	\$ 61.05	\$ 53.42	\$ 47.16	\$ 45.08			
Glenview IL	\$ 594.00	\$ 439.20	\$ 439.20	\$ 439.20	\$ 1,485.60	\$ 915.75	\$ 1,068.40	\$ 1,509.12	\$ 2,704.80	no bid	no bid	no bid
Pyramid School Prods.	\$ 4.85	\$ 3.59	\$ 3.59	\$ 3.59	\$ 12.12				\$ 45.98			
Tampa FL	\$ 582.00	\$ 430.80	\$ 430.80	\$ 430.80	\$ 1,454.40	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 2,758.80	no bid	no bid	no bid
Standard Companies	\$ 5.55	\$ 4.10	\$ 4.10	\$ 4.10	\$ 13.89	\$ 69.76	\$ 59.99	\$ 52.95	\$ 49.89	\$ 2.69	\$ 2.69	\$ 2.69
Chicago IL	\$ 666.00	\$ 492.00	\$ 492.00	\$ 492.00	\$ 1,666.80	\$ 1,046.40	\$ 1,199.80	\$ 1,694.40	\$ 2,993.40	\$ 1,614.00	\$ 1,614.00	\$ 1,614.00
Supplyworks	\$ 8.50	\$ 4.95	\$ 4.95	\$ 4.95	\$ 9.65	\$ 47.75	\$ 41.65	\$ 39.00	\$ 39.50	\$ 2.15	\$ 2.15	\$ 2.15
Lombard IL	\$ 1,020.00	\$ 594.00	\$ 594.00	\$ 594.00	\$ 1,158.00	\$ 716.25	\$ 833.00	\$ 1,248.00	\$ 2,370.00	\$ 1,290.00	\$ 1,290.00	\$ 1,290.00
Unipak Corp.												
Brooklyn NY	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Valdes												
Northbrook IL	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid

**CUSTODIAL CLEANING SUPPLIES - PAPER/MISC**

<b>COMPANY</b>	<b>Georgia Pacific SofPull Mechanical Hardwound Roll Towel Dispenser, Model 59489</b>	<b>Georgia Pacific SofPull Hardwound Roll Paper Towel, white #26470</b>	<b>Universal Bath Tissue Dispenser, Silhouette Dubl-Serv 2-roll Tissue, #72200, Black Translucent</b>	<b>Ecosoft Universal Bath Tissue #54000, white</b>	<b>3M #63 White Light Duty Scrub Sponge</b>	<b>Vacuum Cleaner Bags #86000460 Windsor VS14 &amp; VS18</b>	<b>Rubbermaid #FG9C0400 30"-42" Lambswool Duster with Telescoping Plastic Handle</b>	<b>Vendor Bid Award</b>
<i>Unit Measure</i>	<i>Each</i>	<i>Case</i>	<i>Each</i>	<i>Case</i>	<i>Each</i>	<i>Package</i>	<i>Each</i>	
<b>Item #</b>	<b>25a.</b>	<b>25b.</b>	<b>26a.</b>	<b>26b.</b>	<b>27.</b>	<b>28.</b>	<b>29.</b>	
<b>QUANTITY</b>	<b>500</b>	<b>2000</b>	<b>100</b>	<b>700</b>	<b>1000</b>	<b>800</b>	<b>36</b>	
All American Poly								
Piscataway NJ	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	
Boelter Companies	\$ 10.07	\$ 39.97					\$ 7.69	
Wood Dale IL	\$ 5,035.00	\$ 79,940.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 276.84	\$ 2,586.30
Calico Industries							\$ 8.98	
Annapolis Junction MO	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 323.28	
CCP Industries					\$ 2.15	\$ 6.85		
Island Lake IL	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 2,150.00	\$ 5,480.00	no bid	
Central Poly								
Linden NJ	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	
Chemcraft					\$ 1.60		\$ 7.69	
Chicago IL	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 1,600.00	no bid	\$ 276.84	\$ 793.20
Dispose N Save								
Monroe NY	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	
Dyna Pak								
Lawrenceburg TN	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	
e Poly Star Inc.								
Tampa FL	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	
Image Systems	\$ 29.29	\$ 57.46						
Elk Grove IL	\$ 14,645.00	\$ 114,920.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	
Interboro Packaging								
Montgomery NY	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	
Kranz Inc.	\$ 27.45	\$ 54.40	\$ 16.30	\$ 31.50		\$ 6.50	\$ 8.10	
Racine WI	\$ 13,725.00	\$ 108,800.00	\$ 1,630.00	\$ 22,050.00	no bid	\$ 5,200.00	\$ 291.60	
Metro Prof. Prods.			\$ 16.15	\$ 30.51		\$ 6.59		
Des Plaines IL	no bid	no bid	\$ 1,615.00	\$ 21,357.00	no bid	\$ 5,272.00	no bid	\$ 22,972.00

**CUSTODIAL CLEANING SUPPLIES - PAPER/MISC**

<b>COMPANY</b>	<b>Georgia Pacific SofPull Mechanical Hardwound Roll Towel Dispenser, Model 59489</b>	<b>Georgia Pacific SofPull Hardwound Roll Paper Towel, white #26470</b>	<b>Universal Bath Tissue Dispenser, Silhouette Dubl-Serv 2-roll Tissue, #72200, Black Translucent</b>	<b>Ecosoft Universal Bath Tissue #54000, white</b>	<b>3M #63 White Light Duty Scrub Sponge</b>	<b>Vacuum Cleaner Bags #86000460 Windsor VS14 &amp; VS18</b>	<b>Rubbermaid #FG9C0400 30"-42" Lambswool Duster with Telescoping Plastic Handle</b>	<b>Vendor Bid Award</b>
<i>Unit Measure</i>	<i>Each</i>	<i>Case</i>	<i>Each</i>	<i>Case</i>	<i>Each</i>	<i>Package</i>	<i>Each</i>	
<b>Item #</b>	<b>25a.</b>	<b>25b.</b>	<b>26a.</b>	<b>26b.</b>	<b>27.</b>	<b>28.</b>	<b>29.</b>	
<b>QUANTITY</b>	<b>500</b>	<b>2000</b>	<b>100</b>	<b>700</b>	<b>1000</b>	<b>800</b>	<b>36</b>	
North American Corp.	\$ 10.89	\$ 43.25	\$ 16.34	\$ 31.60		\$ 8.88	\$ 7.86	
Glenview IL	\$ 5,445.00	\$ 86,500.00	\$ 1,634.00	\$ 22,120.00	\$ 1,692.00	\$ 7,104.00	\$ 282.96	\$ 7,104.00
Pyramid School Prods.					\$ 1.62		\$ 7.69	
Tampa FL	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 1,620.00	no bid	\$ 276.84	
Standard Companies					\$ 1.83	\$ 14.72	\$ 8.80	
Chicago IL	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 1,830.00	\$11,776.00	\$ 316.80	
Supplyworks		\$ 39.70	\$ 20.00	\$ 32.45	\$ 1.55	\$ 8.95	\$ 6.95	
Lombard IL	<b>N/C</b>	<b>\$ 79,400.00</b>	\$ 2,000.00	\$ 22,715.00	<b>\$ 1,550.00</b>	\$ 7,160.00	<b>\$ 250.20</b>	\$ 101,847.75
Unipak Corp.								
Brooklyn NY	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 31,300.00
Valdes								
Northbrook IL	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	

**CUSTODIAL CLEANING SUPPLIES - CHEMICALS**

COMPANY	Acid (9%or more) Bowl Cleaner	Non-Acid Bowl Cleaner & Disinfectant 12 Qts/CS	Spartan Consume (or Equal) Odor Enzyme	Sealed Air Virex II 256 Disinfectant #5271416 2/CS	Sealed Air #32 Speedball 2000 Heavy Duty Cleaner #5893063	Sealed Air #50 Raindance Low Foam Neutral Floor Cleaner #3323981	Sealed Air Non-Ammoniated Glass & Multi-Surface Cleaner #5271310	Sealed Air Carpet Extraction Cleaner #5271395	Sealed Air Heavy Duty Carpet Prespray #04266	Sealed Air Carpet Shampoo, #5002689	Sealed Air Carpet Defoamer #5002620	PDI® Sani-Cloth® Plus Disinfectant Wipes Q10584
Unit Measure	Case	Case	Case	Case	Case	Case	Case	Case	Case	Case	Case	Each
Item #	1.	2.	3.	4.	5.	6.	7.	8.	9.	10.	11.	12.
QUANTITY	25	150	100	150	100	100	20	64	30	60	80	750
All American Poly												
Piscataway NJ	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Boelter Companies												
Wood Dale IL	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Calico Industries												
Annapolis Junction MO	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
CCP Industries												
Island Lake IL	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Central Poly												
Linden NJ	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Chemcraft	\$ 14.87		\$ 27.27									
Chicago IL	\$ 371.75	no bid	\$ 2,727.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Dispose N Save												
Monroe NY	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Dyna Pak												
Lawrenceburg TN	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
e Poly Star Inc.												
Tampa FL	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Image Systems												
Elk Grove IL	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Interboro Packaging												
Montgomery NY	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Kranz Inc.	\$ 16.38	\$ 17.80	\$ 28.05	\$ 101.46	\$ 133.70	\$ 117.38	\$ 103.20	\$ 72.85	\$ 89.14	\$ 61.00	\$ 25.88	
Racine WI	\$ 409.50	\$ 2,670.00	\$ 2,805.00	\$15,219.00	\$13,370.00	\$ 11,738.00	\$ 2,064.00	\$ 4,662.40	\$ 2,674.20	\$ 3,660.00	\$ 2,070.40	no bid
Metro Prof. Prods.	\$ 15.75	\$ 17.26	\$ 25.16									
Des Plaines IL	\$ 393.75	\$ 2,589.00	\$ 2,516.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
North American Corp.	\$ 23.40		\$ 20.52									
Glenview IL	\$ 585.00	no bid	\$ 2,052.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Pyramid School Prods.												
Tampa FL	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Standard Companies	\$ 20.69		\$ 31.13						\$ 100.26	\$ 68.62	\$ 29.11	



**CUSTODIAL CLEANING SUPPLIES - CHEMICALS**

<b>COMPANY</b>	<b>Acid (9%or more) Bowl Cleaner</b>	<b>Non-Acid Bowl Cleaner &amp; Disinfectant 12 Qts/CS</b>	<b>Spartan Consume (or Equal) Odor Enzyme</b>	<b>Sealed Air Virex II 256 Disinfectant #5271416 2/CS</b>	<b>Sealed Air #32 Speedball 2000 Heavy Duty Cleaner #5893063</b>	<b>Sealed Air #50 Raindance Low Foam Neutral Floor Cleaner #3323981</b>	<b>Sealed Air Non-Ammoniated Glass &amp; Multi-Surface Cleaner #5271310</b>	<b>Sealed Air Carpet Extraction Cleaner #5271395</b>	<b>Sealed Air Heavy Duty Carpet Prespray #04266</b>	<b>Sealed Air Carpet Shampoo, #5002689</b>	<b>Sealed Air Carpet Defoamer #5002620</b>	<b>PDI® Sani-Cloth® Plus Disinfectant Wipes Q10584</b>
<i>Unit Measure</i>	<i>Case</i>	<i>Case</i>	<i>Case</i>	<i>Case</i>	<i>Case</i>	<i>Case</i>	<i>Case</i>	<i>Case</i>	<i>Case</i>	<i>Case</i>	<i>Case</i>	<i>Each</i>
<b>Item #</b>	<b>1.</b>	<b>2.</b>	<b>3.</b>	<b>4.</b>	<b>5.</b>	<b>6.</b>	<b>7.</b>	<b>8.</b>	<b>9.</b>	<b>10.</b>	<b>11.</b>	<b>12.</b>
<b>QUANTITY</b>	<b>25</b>	<b>150</b>	<b>100</b>	<b>150</b>	<b>100</b>	<b>100</b>	<b>20</b>	<b>64</b>	<b>30</b>	<b>60</b>	<b>80</b>	<b>750</b>
Chicago IL	\$ 517.25	no bid	\$ 3,113.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 3,007.80	\$ 4,117.20	\$ 2,328.80	no bid
Supplyworks	\$ 16.50	\$ 17.85	\$ 19.50	\$ 74.50	\$ 99.50	\$ 89.50	\$ 79.95	\$ 66.50	\$ 74.50	\$ 56.75	\$ 23.50	\$ 7.20
Lombard IL	\$ 412.50	\$ 2,677.50	\$ 1,950.00	\$11,175.00	\$ 9,950.00	\$ 8,950.00	\$ 1,599.00	\$ 4,256.00	\$ 2,235.00	\$ 3,405.00	\$ 1,880.00	\$ 5,400.00
Unipak Corp.												
Brooklyn NY	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Valdes	\$ 14.95		\$ 23.14									
Northbrook IL	\$ 373.75	no bid	\$ 2,314.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid

**CUSTODIAL CLEANING SUPPLIES - CHEMICALS**

Motsenbocker's Lift Off #1 Stain Remover	Sealed Air Vectra Floor Finish #5105047	Avant Hand Sanitizer, #34369 for Model 3400 Deluxe Dispenser	GoJo® Green Seal Foam Hand Soap #5165-03	Sealed Air Recoat Adhesion Formula & Tacking Solution #5142243	Sealed Air Ultra Low Odor Waterbased Finish #5142227	Sealed Air Waterborne Finish Crosslinker #5142235	Vendor Bid Award
<i>Case</i>	<i>Box</i>	<i>Box</i>	<i>Case</i>	<i>Pail</i>	<i>Pail</i>	<i>Pail</i>	
13.	14.	15.	16.	17.	18.	19.	
60	150	100	1200	40	60	60	
no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	
no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	
no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	
			\$ 34.05				
no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 40,860.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	
no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	
\$ 41.85			\$ 35.26				
\$ 2,511.00	no bid	no bid	\$ 42,312.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 371.75
no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	
no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	
no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	
no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	
no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	
no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	
	\$ 77.10		\$ 37.95	\$ 145.42	\$ 252.32	\$ 43.72	
no bid	\$ 11,565.00	no bid	\$ 45,540.00	\$ 5,816.80	\$ 15,139.20	\$ 2,623.20	
			\$ 24.12				
no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 28,944.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 2,589.00
\$ 54.48			\$ 38.41				
\$ 3,268.80	no bid	no bid	\$ 46,092.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	
\$ 41.29			\$ 45.99				
\$ 2,477.40	no bid	no bid	\$ 55,188.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 2,477.40
\$ 42.69	\$ 86.79		\$ 40.72				

**CUSTODIAL CLEANING SUPPLIES - CHEMICALS**

<b>Motsenbocker's Lift Off #1 Stain Remover</b>	<b>Sealed Air Vectra Floor Finish #5105047</b>	<b>Avant Hand Sanitizer, #34369 for Model 3400 Deluxe Dispenser</b>	<b>GoJo® Green Seal Foam Hand Soap #5165-03</b>	<b>Sealed Air Recoat Adhesion Formula &amp; Tacking Solution #5142243</b>	<b>Sealed Air Ultra Low Odor Waterbased Finish #5142227</b>	<b>Sealed Air Waterborne Finish Crosslinker #5142235</b>	<b>Vendor Bid Award</b>
<i>Case</i>	<i>Box</i>	<i>Box</i>	<i>Case</i>	<i>Pail</i>	<i>Pail</i>	<i>Pail</i>	
<b>13.</b>	<b>14.</b>	<b>15.</b>	<b>16.</b>	<b>17.</b>	<b>18.</b>	<b>19.</b>	
<b>60</b>	<b>150</b>	<b>100</b>	<b>1200</b>	<b>40</b>	<b>60</b>	<b>60</b>	
\$ 2,561.40	\$ 13,018.50	no bid	\$ 48,864.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	
	\$ 50.45		\$ 28.95	\$ 124.50	\$ 237.00	\$ 36.40	
no bid	\$ 7,567.50	no bid	\$ 34,740.00	\$ 4,980.00	\$ 14,220.00	\$ 2,184.00	\$ 114,491.50
no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	
	\$ 49.48						
no bid	\$ 7,422.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	