



Serving all or part of:
 Palatine • Rolling Meadows • Inverness
 Arlington Heights • Hoffman Estates
 Schaumburg • South Barrington

Community Consolidated School District 15

Joseph M. Kiszka Educational Service Center
 580 N. 1st Bank Drive
 Palatine, IL 60067-8110

Michael Adamczyk
 Chief School Business Official

(847) 963-3032 • Fax (847) 963-3061
 www.ccsd15.net



DATE: October 11, 2017
TO: Board of Education
FROM: Michael Adamczyk, CSBO
 Ivy Fleming, Budget & Purchasing Coordinator
RE: Action Item – Bid #18-001 Custodial Cleaning Supplies

Background

Bid specifications for custodial cleaning supplies were published in the Daily Herald Newspaper on August 30, 2017 and posted on the District website on August 21, 2017. Bid instructions were emailed to 17 vendors and we received 15 responses. This is an annual purchase and these supplies are used at all facilities for cleaning. Items listed in Category 1 were awarded by line item. Category 2 through Category 6 were awarded by group. Awarding products to one vendor by brand gives the district continuity for the ordering process and requires a sole vendor to provide the necessary training related to each category.

Results

VENDOR	Category 1 Miscellaneous	Category 2 Rubbermaid	Category 3 3M	Category 4 Georgia Pacific	Category 5 Sealed Air	Category 6 GoJo	TOTAL BID AWARD
All American Poly Piscataway, NJ	\$ 6,390.00						\$ 6,390.00
Chemcraft Chicago, IL	\$ 18,258.00						\$ 18,258.00
Supplyworks Lombard, IL	\$ 6,640.00		\$ 19,477.00	\$ 98,125.00	\$ 41,003.00	\$ 55,162.50	\$ 220,407.50
Unipak Brooklyn, NY	\$ 23,250.00						\$ 23,250.00
Warehouse Direct Des Plaines, IL	\$ 25,150.00	\$ 5,189.22					\$ 30,339.22
TOTALS:	\$ 79,688.00	\$ 5,189.22	\$ 19,477.00	\$ 98,125.00	\$ 41,003.00	\$ 55,162.50	\$ 298,644.72

Recommendation

It is recommended that the Board of Education award the custodial cleaning supplies bid to five vendors in the amounts listed above. The total expenditure for custodial cleaning supplies in 2017-2018 is \$298,644.72. Recommendations are based on low bid vendors meeting bid specifications. The expenditure is budgeted in the 2017-2018 Operation and Maintenance Fund Budget.

Bid documents are on file in the business office for review.

CUSTODIAL CLEANING SUPPLIES 2017-2018

Category 1: Miscellaneous											
COMPANY	Black Can Liner, Large 48 Gallon 100/Box, Flat Bottom Sealed	Black Can Liner, Small 26 Gallon 100/Box, Flat Bottom Sealed	Superior "No Trax" 4'x8' Floor Mat Carpet Runners	Superior "No Trax" 3'x6' Floor Mat Carpet Runners	PDI® Sani-Cloth® Plus Disinfectant Wipes Q10584	Cellulose Sponge, Yellow, 6-1/4"x 3-3/8"x1"	Acid (9%or more) Bowl Cleaner	Non-Acid Bowl Cleaner & Disinfectant 12 Qts/CS	Spartan Consume (or Equal) Odor Enzyme 12 Qts/CS	Ecosoft Universal Bath Tissue #54000, white	Vacuum Cleaner Bags #86000460 Windsor VS14 & VS18 10/pkg
Unit Measure	Box	Box	Each	Each	Each	Each	Case	Case	Case	Case	Package
Item #	1.	2.	3.	4.	5.	6.	7.	8.	9.	10.	11.
QUANTITY	1500	1000	150	50	1000	4,000	25	200	100	700	400
All American Poly Piscataway NJ	\$ 14.93 \$ 22,395.00	\$ 6.39 \$ 6,390.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
American Pride Paper Lakewood NJ	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 29.75 \$ 20,825.00	no bid
Boelter Companies Chicago IL	\$ 17.50 \$ 26,250.00	\$ 9.50 \$ 9,500.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
CCP Industries Richmond Hts OH	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Calico Industrial Supply Annapolis Junction MD	\$ 16.24 \$ 24,360.00	\$ 8.14 \$ 8,140.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Chemcraft Chicago IL	\$ 17.61 \$ 26,415.00	\$ 9.06 \$ 9,060.00	\$ 52.00 \$ 7,800.00	\$ 29.50 \$ 1,475.00	\$ 6.80 \$ 6,800.00	\$ 0.80 \$ 3,200.00	\$ 15.40 \$ 385.00	no bid	\$ 17.98 \$ 1,798.00	\$ 37.25 \$ 26,075.00	\$ 13.74 \$ 5,496.00
HP Products Alsip IL	\$ 20.31 \$ 30,465.00	no bid	\$ 58.61 \$ 8,791.50	\$ 33.95 \$ 1,697.50	no bid	no bid	\$ 15.84 \$ 396.00	\$ 18.34 \$ 3,668.00	\$ 28.11 \$ 2,811.00	no bid	\$ 10.91 \$ 4,364.00
Interboro Packaging Montgomery NY	\$ 14.32 \$ 21,480.00	\$ 7.18 \$ 7,180.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Pyramid School Prods. Tampa FL	no bid	no bid	\$ 54.78 \$ 8,217.00	\$ 30.79 \$ 1,539.50	no bid	\$ 0.69 \$ 2,760.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Supplyworks Lombard IL	no bid	no bid	\$ 54.75 \$ 8,212.50	\$ 30.75 \$ 1,537.50	\$ 8.55 \$ 8,550.00	\$ 0.72 \$ 2,880.00	\$ 16.50 \$ 412.50	\$ 19.35 \$ 3,870.00	\$ 23.00 \$ 2,300.00	\$ 33.95 \$ 23,765.00	\$ 9.40 \$ 3,760.00
Unipak Corp. Brooklyn NY	\$ 15.50 \$ 23,250.00	\$ 7.20 \$ 7,200.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Warehouse Direct Des Plaines IL	\$ 18.10 \$ 27,150.00	\$ 9.80 \$ 9,800.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 17.95 \$ 3,590.00	no bid	\$ 30.80 \$ 21,560.00	\$ 13.84 \$ 5,536.00
Items in black do not meet bid specifications.											

CUSTODIAL CLEANING SUPPLIES 2017-2018

Category 2: Rubbermaid Products											
COMPANY	Rubbermaid #FG264300, BRUTE Container 44 gal, BLUE, no lid	Rubbermaid #FG264300, BRUTE Container 44 gal, GRAY, no lid	Rubbermaid #FG9C0400 30"-42" Lambswool Duster with Telescoping Plastic Handle	Microfiber Rubbermaid #FGQ55000 YL00 11" Quick Connect Wall/Straight Frame	Microfiber Rubbermaid #FGQ82000 BL00 11" Single Side Wall/Stair Damp Mop	Rubbermaid #FGD11306 WHOO Super Stitched Cotton Lopped-End Wet Mop, 5" head band	Rubbermaid #FGQ95088 Charging Bucket YEL. (3/pack)	Microfiber Rubbermaid #FGQ76500 YL00 4'x8' Quick Connect Extension Pole	Microfiber Rubbermaid #FGQ41000 BL00 18" Single Side Damp Mop	Microfiber Rubbermaid #FGQ41100 BL00 24" Single Side Damp Mop	Category 2 TOTALS
Unit Measure	Each	Each	Each	Each	Each	Each	Each	Each	Each	Each	
Item #	12.	13.	14.	15.	16.	17.	18.	19.	20.	21.	
QUANTITY	30	30	36	36	120	180	24	24	120	120	
All American Poly Piscataway NJ	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ -
American Pride Paper Lakewood NJ	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ -
Boelter Companies Chicago IL	\$ 20.50 \$ 615.00	\$ 20.50 \$ 615.00	\$ 10.79 \$ 388.44	\$ 10.55 \$ 379.80	\$ 6.50 \$ 780.00	\$ 3.35 \$ 603.00	\$ 59.98 \$ 1,439.52	\$ 59.50 \$ 1,428.00	\$ 6.45 \$ 774.00	\$ 9.99 \$ 1,198.80	\$ 6,782.04
CCP Industries Richmond Hts OH	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ -
Calico Industrial Supply Annapolis Junction MD	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ -
Chemcraft Chicago IL	\$ 49.20 \$ 1,476.00	\$ 49.20 \$ 1,476.00	\$ 9.59 \$ 345.24	\$ 14.33 \$ 515.88	\$ 9.00 \$ 1,080.00	\$ 7.57 \$ 1,362.60	\$ 49.35 \$ 1,184.40	\$ 51.00 \$ 1,224.00	\$ 8.90 \$ 1,068.00	\$ 13.62 \$ 1,634.40	\$ 10,182.12
HP Products Alsip IL	\$ 24.80 \$ 744.00	\$ 24.80 \$ 744.00	\$ 2.14 \$ 77.04	\$ 11.59 \$ 417.24	\$ 7.14 \$ 856.80	\$ 3.45 \$ 621.00	\$ 63.84 \$ 1,532.16	\$ 70.78 \$ 1,698.72	\$ 5.75 \$ 690.00	\$ 10.29 \$ 1,234.80	\$ 7,083.60
Interboro Packaging Montgomery NY	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ -
Pyramid School Prods. Tampa FL	\$ 19.98 \$ 599.40	\$ 24.79 \$ 743.70	\$ 2.99 \$ 107.64	\$ 9.99 \$ 359.64	\$ 6.59 \$ 790.80	\$ 3.29 \$ 592.20	\$ 48.99 \$ 1,175.76	\$ 54.94 \$ 1,318.56	\$ 6.09 \$ 730.80	\$ 9.55 \$ 1,146.00	\$ 6,388.74
Supplyworks Lombard IL	\$ 25.60 \$ 768.00	\$ 25.60 \$ 768.00	\$ 7.25 \$ 261.00	\$ 10.55 \$ 379.80	\$ 7.25 \$ 870.00	\$ 6.75 \$ 1,215.00	\$ 28.50 \$ 684.00	\$ 44.50 \$ 1,068.00	\$ 5.75 \$ 690.00	\$ 9.25 \$ 1,110.00	\$ 7,129.80
Unipak Corp. Brooklyn NY	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ -
Warehouse Direct Des Plaines IL	\$ 13.75 \$ 412.50	\$ 20.66 \$ 619.80	\$ 1.88 \$ 67.68	\$ 10.30 \$ 370.80	\$ 6.35 \$ 762.00	\$ 4.43 \$ 797.40	no bid	\$ 10.11 \$ 242.64	\$ 6.25 \$ 750.00	\$ 9.72 \$ 1,166.40	\$ 5,189.22
After further review Rubbermaid #FGQ95088 was removed from the bid and not included in the Category 2 totals. This item is not needed for the 17-18 school year.											

CUSTODIAL CLEANING SUPPLIES 2017-2018

Category 3: 3M Products													
COMPANY	3M Easy Shine Wax Applicator Kit #55433	3M Easy Shine Wax Fill Station #59175	3M Easy Shine Wax Applicator Pad #55434 10 ea/case	3M Easy Shine Reuseable Wax Applicator Pouch #55440 5 pouches/case	3M #63 White Light Duty Scrub Sponge	14" x 20" 3M Maroon SPP Surface Prep Pad 10 /case	14" x 28" 3M Maroon SPP Surface Prep Pad 10 /case	20" 3M 7200 Black Floor Stripping Pad 5 /case	20" 3M 5100 Blue Floor Scrubbing Pad 5 /case	20" 3M 4100 White Floor Super Polish Pad 5 /case	14" x 20" 3M 4100 White Floor Polish Pad 10 /case	14" x 28" 3M 4100 White Floor Polish Pad 10 /case	Category 3 TOTALS
Unit Measure	Each	Each	Each	Case	Each	Case	Case	Case	Case	Case	Case	Case	
Item #	22.	23.	24.	25.	26.	27.	28.	29.	30.	31.	32.	33.	
QUANTITY	10	10	20	20	2400	20	40	40	50	50	20	40	
All American Poly Piscataway NJ	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ -
American Pride Paper Lakewood NJ	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ -
Boelter Companies Chicago IL	\$ 291.25 \$ 2,912.50	\$ 63.17 \$ 631.70	\$ 88.50 \$ 1,770.00	\$ 54.60 \$ 1,092.00	\$ 1.86 \$ 4,464.00	\$ 112.98 \$ 2,259.60	\$ 121.33 \$ 4,853.20	\$ 28.75 \$ 1,150.00	\$ 27.94 \$ 1,397.00	\$ 27.94 \$ 1,397.00	\$ 53.39 \$ 1,067.80	\$ 60.50 \$ 2,420.00	\$ 25,414.80
CCP Industries Richmond Hts OH	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ -
Calico Industrial Supply Annapolis Junction MD	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ -
Chemcraft Chicago IL	\$ 223.00 \$ 2,230.00	\$ 59.15 \$ 591.50	\$ 66.56 \$ 1,331.20	\$ 41.09 \$ 821.80	\$ 1.36 \$ 3,264.00	\$ 106.09 \$ 2,121.80	\$ 114.12 \$ 4,564.80	\$ 22.37 \$ 894.80	\$ 21.77 \$ 1,088.50	\$ 21.77 \$ 1,088.50	\$ 49.10 \$ 982.00	\$ 55.60 \$ 2,224.00	\$ 21,202.90
HP Products Alsip IL	\$ 254.81 \$ 2,548.10	\$ 69.86 \$ 698.60	\$ 76.00 \$ 1,520.00	\$ 46.94 \$ 938.80	\$ 1.56 \$ 3,744.00	\$ 121.18 \$ 2,423.60	\$ 130.35 \$ 5,214.00	\$ 25.55 \$ 1,022.00	\$ 24.87 \$ 1,243.50	\$ 24.87 \$ 1,243.50	\$ 56.08 \$ 1,121.60	\$ 63.52 \$ 2,540.80	\$ 24,258.50
Interboro Packaging Montgomery NY	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ -
Pyramid School Prods. Tampa FL	\$ 279.98 \$ 2,799.80	\$ 69.98 \$ 699.80	\$ 89.98 \$ 1,799.60	\$ 59.75 \$ 1,195.00	\$ 1.73 \$ 4,152.00	\$ 78.90 \$ 1,578.00	\$ 128.90 \$ 5,156.00	\$ 28.40 \$ 1,136.00	\$ 27.90 \$ 1,395.00	\$ 27.90 \$ 1,395.00	\$ 54.25 \$ 1,085.00	\$ 57.75 \$ 2,310.00	\$ 24,701.20
Supplyworks Lombard IL	\$ 249.00 \$ 2,490.00	\$ 55.00 \$ 550.00	\$ 16.00 \$ 320.00	\$ 8.95 \$ 179.00	\$ 1.45 \$ 3,480.00	\$ 110.00 \$ 2,200.00	\$ 119.00 \$ 4,760.00	\$ 21.65 \$ 866.00	\$ 21.10 \$ 1,055.00	\$ 21.10 \$ 1,055.00	\$ 41.50 \$ 830.00	\$ 42.30 \$ 1,692.00	\$ 19,477.00
Unipak Corp. Brooklyn NY	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ -
Warehouse Direct Des Plaines IL	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ -

CUSTODIAL CLEANING SUPPLIES 2017-2018

Category 4: Georgia Pacific			
COMPANY	Georgia Pacific SofPull Mechanical Hardwound Roll Towel Dispenser, Model 59489	Georgia Pacific SofPull Hardwound Roll Paper Towel, white #26470	Category 4 TOTALS
<i>Unit Measure</i>	<i>Each</i>	<i>Case</i>	
Item #	34.	35.	
QUANTITY	500	2500	
All American Poly Piscataway NJ	no bid	no bid	\$ -
American Pride Paper Lakewood NJ	no bid	\$ 15.99 \$ 39,975.00	\$ 39,975.00
Boelter Companies Chicago IL	\$ 24.50 \$ 12,250.00	\$ 42.94 \$ 107,350.00	\$ 119,600.00
CCP Industries Richmond Hts OH	no bid	no bid	\$ -
Calico Industrial Supply Annapolis Junction MD	no bid	no bid	\$ -
Chemcraft Chicago IL	no bid	no bid	\$ -
HP Products Alsip IL	\$ 5.49 \$ 2,745.00	\$ 44.07 \$ 110,175.00	\$ 112,920.00
Interboro Packaging Montgomery NY	no bid	no bid	\$ -
Pyramid School Prods. Tampa FL	no bid	no bid	\$ -
Supplyworks Lombard IL	N/C	\$ 39.25 \$ 98,125.00	\$ 98,125.00
Unipak Corp. Brooklyn NY	no bid	no bid	\$ -
Warehouse Direct Des Plaines IL	no bid	no bid	\$ -
Items in black do not meet bid specifications.			

CUSTODIAL CLEANING SUPPLIES 2017-2018

Category 5: Sealed Air											
COMPANY	Sealed Air #3755388 MicroQuick® Microfiber Towel for glass. BLUE 16" x 16"	Sealed Air #3755311 MicroQuick® Microfiber Towel for glass. GREEN 16" x 16"	Sealed Air #3755396 MicroQuick® Microfiber Towel for glass. RED 16" x 16"	Sealed Air #95032360 Prostrip Heavy Duty Floor Stripper, 5-gal. box	Sealed Air #2 Glance NA Glass Cleaner #93361936 (2/case) RTD	Sealed Air #50 Raissance Low Foam Neutral Floor Cleaner #3222981	Sealed Air Vectra Floor Finish #5105047 5-gal. box	Sealed Air Woodcare Recoat Adhesion Formula & Tacking Solution #5142242	Sealed Air Woodcare Ultra Low Odor Waterbased Finish #5142227	Sealed Air Woodcare Waterborne Finish Crosslinker #5142235	Category 5 TOTALS
Unit Measure	Each	Each	Each	Case	Case	Case	Box	Pail	Pail	Pail	
Item #	36.	37.	38.	39.	40.	41.	42.	43.	44.	45.	
QUANTITY	300	300	300	100	50	50	200	10	40	40	
All American Poly Piscataway NJ	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ -
American Pride Paper Lakewood NJ	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ -
Boelter Companies Chicago IL	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ -
CCP Industries Richmond Hts OH	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ -
Calico Industrial Supply Annapolis Junction MD	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ -
Chemcraft Chicago IL	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ -
HP Products Alsip IL	\$ 3.15 \$ 945.00	\$ 3.15 \$ 945.00	\$ 3.15 \$ 945.00	\$ 98.69 \$ 9,869.00	\$ 47.43 \$ 2,371.50	\$ 133.57 \$ 6,678.50	\$ 83.86 \$ 16,772.00	\$ 221.98 \$ 2,219.80	\$ 317.14 \$ 12,685.60	\$ 52.86 \$ 2,114.40	\$ 55,545.80
Interboro Packaging Montgomery NY	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ -
Pyramid School Prods. Tampa FL	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ -
Supplyworks Lombard IL	\$ 2.55 \$ 765.00	\$ 2.55 \$ 765.00	\$ 2.55 \$ 765.00	\$ 67.95 \$ 6,795.00	\$ 43.76 \$ 2,188.00	\$ 98.50 \$ 4,925.00	\$ 61.95 \$ 12,390.00	\$ 145.00 \$ 1,450.00	\$ 235.00 \$ 9,400.00	\$ 39.00 \$ 1,560.00	\$ 41,003.00
Unipak Corp. Brooklyn NY	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ -
Warehouse Direct Des Plaines IL	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ -

CUSTODIAL CLEANING SUPPLIES 2017-2018

Category 6: GoJo Products				
COMPANY	GoJo Purell® Advanced Green Certified Instant Hand Sanitizer Foam, #GO18804-03-	GoJo® Green Seal Foam Hand Soap, #5165-03, 3/case Hand Soap #5165-03	GoJo® Soap Dispenser (black) #5155- 06, (6/case)	Category 6 TOTALS
<i>Unit Measure</i>	<i>Case</i>	<i>Case</i>	<i>Each</i>	
<i>Item #</i>	46.	47.	48.	
<i>QUANTITY</i>	150	1600	400	
All American Poly Piscataway NJ	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ -
American Pride Paper Lakewood NJ	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ -
Boelter Companies Chicago IL	\$ 54.50 \$ 8,175.00	\$ 35.19 \$ 56,304.00	N/C	\$ 64,479.00
CCP Industries Richmond Hts OH	\$ 54.05 \$ 8,107.50	\$ 35.10 \$ 56,160.00	N/C	\$ 64,267.50
Calico Industrial Supply Annapolis Junction MD	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ -
Chemcraft Chicago IL	\$ 55.20 \$ 8,280.00	\$ 35.57 \$ 56,912.00	N/C	\$ 65,192.00
HP Products Alsip IL	\$ 60.92 \$ 9,138.00	\$ 39.28 \$ 62,848.00	N/C	\$ 71,986.00
Interboro Packaging Montgomery NY	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ -
Pyramid School Prods. Tampa FL	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ -
Supplyworks Lombard IL	\$ 58.95 \$ 8,842.50	\$ 28.95 \$ 46,320.00	N/C	\$ 55,162.50
Unipak Corp. Brooklyn NY	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ -
Warehouse Direct Des Plaines IL	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ -