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Palatine « Rolling Meadows « Inverness (847) 963-3032 ¢ Fax (847) 963-3061
N Senaumbung  Souh Baringion - www.ccsd15.net
To: Board of Education
From: Michael Adamczyk, CSBO

Ivy Fleming, Budget & Purchasing Coordinator
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Subject: Action ltem- BID #17-019 General Office, Art and Paper Supplies

BID #17-019 GENERAL OFFICE, PAPER & ART SUPPLIES

Background

Bid specifications for General Office, Art & Paper Supplies were posted on the District website on
March 14, 2017 and published in the Daily Herald newspaper on March 17, 2017. Bid documents were
sent to fourteen vendors. Seven bids were received and one no bid.

The General Office, Paper & Art Supplies bid consists of miscellaneous art, writing, paper and
classroom supplies which in the past were stored at the Central Distribution Facility. This year we are
moving to a “Just in Time” delivery system. This will allow more flexibility for our district in terms of
product selection, product pricing and delivery time. Under this new system, our district will have
access to a wider selection of products with an additional 40% off catalog price. Orders placed before
4:00 pm will arrive the following day at no cost for shipping.

Results

Please see attached bid award summary.

Recommendation

It is recommended that the Board of Education award a contract to School Specialty for a one-year
contract with an optional additional one-year renewal. The anticipated total contract amount is
estimated to be $500,000. This is based on the previous year usage with in the district.
Recommendations are based on the vendor’s ability to best meet the needs of the district with
manufacturer discounts, rebate incentives, delivery service and selection of products. This bid is
budgeted in the supply accounts in the Educational Fund, Operation and Maintenance Fund and
Transportation Fund for 2017-18 school year.

Bid documents are on file in the business office for review.

Jane Addams ¢ Central Road « Conyers Learning Academy ¢ Kimball Hill «+ Hunting Ridge * Thomas Jefferson « Marion Jordan « Lake Louise ¢ Lincoln
Stuart R. Paddock ¢ Pleasant Hill « Gray M. Sanborn « Virginia Lake * Frank C. Whiteley * Willow Bend * Winston Campus Elementary
Plum Grove Junior High ¢ Carl Sandburg Junior High * Walter R. Sundling Junior High * Winston Campus Junior High



EXHIBIT "B"
BID #17-019 General Office, Paper, Art Supplies

VENDOR BID FORMS

ART PAPER

Company Name

ACCO OFFICE DEPOT TREE HOUSE COPY TECHNOLOGIES| STANDARD STATIONERY| S&S WORLDWIDE SCHOOL SPECIALTY
QTY UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT UNIT TOTAL UNIT

Item # Description Line 1 Description Line 2 U/M|ORDER| COST COST UNIT COST | TOTAL COST | COST COST COST COST COST TOTAL COST | COST COST COST | TOTAL COST
100004 |Paper, Construction-#24R RIVERSIDE NO SUBS Black 12"x18", 50 sht/rm #3631 RM 1073[NO BID - 1.74 1,867.02 |[NO BID - NO BID - 1.87 2,006.51 1.99 2,135.27 7.25 7,779.25
100005  |Paper, Construction-#15R RIVERSIDE NO SUBS Dark Blue 12"x18", 50 sht/rm #3625 RM 462|NO BID - 1.97 910.14 [NO BID - NO BID - 1.77 817.74 1.91 882.42 7.25 3,349.50
100006  |Paper, Construction-#23R RIVERSIDE NO SUBS Dark Brown 12"x18", 50 sht/rm #3630 RM 252|NO BID - 1.96 493.92 [NO BID - NO BID - 1.83 461.16 1.98 498.96 7.25 1,827.00
100007 _ |Paper, Construction-#14R RIVERSIDE NO SUBS Blue 12"x18", 50 sht/rm #3624 RM 428|NO BID - 1.77 757.56 [NO BID - NO BID - 1.71 731.88 1.83 783.24 7.25 3,103.00
100008 |Paper, Construction-#28R RIVERSIDE NO SUBS Gray 12"x18", 50 sht/rm #3632 RM 126|NO BID - 2.03 255.78 [NO BID - NO BID - 1.70 214.20 1.83 230.58 11.72 1,476.72
100009 [Paper, Construction-#25R RIVERSIDE NO SUBS Holiday Green  [12"x18", 50 sht/rm #3578 RM 558|NO BID - 2.54 1,417.32 |[NO BID - NO BID - 1.72 959.76 1.85 1,032.30 38.37 21,410.46
100010  |Paper, Construction-#9R RIVERSIDE NO SUBS Light Green 12"x18", 50 sht/rm #3619 RM 247|NO BID - 1.96 484.12 [NO BID - NO BID - 1.72 424.84 1.85 456.95 37.34 9,222.98
100011 |Paper, Construction-#13R RIVERSIDE NO SUBS Light Blue 12"x18", 50 sht/rm #3623 RM 529|NO BID - 1.77 936.33 [NO BID - NO BID - 1.69 894.01 1.83 968.07 35.38 18,716.02
100012 |Paper, Construction-#33R RIVERSIDE NO SUBS Light Brown 12"x18", 50 sht/rm #3636 RM 266|NO BID - 1.73 460.18 [NO BID - NO BID - 1.75 465.50 1.89 502.74 47.59 12,658.94
100013 |Paper, Construction-#7R RIVERSIDE NO SUBS Orange 12"x18", 50 sht/rm #3618 RM 507|NO BID - 1.74 882.18 [NO BID - NO BID - 1.75 887.25 1.89 958.23 35.69 18,094.83
100014  |Paper, Construction-#3R RIVERSIDE NO SUBS Pink 12"x18", 50 sht/rm #3615 RM 353|NO BID - 1.99 702.47 [NO BID - NO BID - 1.73 610.69 1.86 656.58 45.31 15,994.43
100015 |Paper, Construction-#19R RIVERSIDE NO SUBS Violet 12"x18", 50 sht/rm #3627 RM 329|NO BID - 2.19 720.51 [NO BID - NO BID - 1.72 565.88 1.85 608.65 7.25 2,385.25
100016 |Paper, Construction-#4R RIVERSIDE NO SUBS Holiday Red 12"x18", 50 sht/rm #3443 RM 875|NO BID - 1.74 1,622.50 |NO BID - NO BID - 1.83 1,601.25 1.93 1,688.75 | NO BID -
100017 _ |Paper, Construction-#1R RIVERSIDE NO SUBS White 12"x18", 50 sht/rm #3613 RM 1465[NO BID - 1.73 2,5634.45 [NO BID - NO BID - 1.89 2,768.85 2.01 2,944.65 | NO BID

100018  |Paper, Construction-#5R RIVERSIDE NO SUBS Yellow 12"x18", 50 sht/rm #3416 RM 838|NO BID - 1.77 1,483.26 |NO BID - NO BID - 1.72 1,441.36 1.85 1,5650.30 | NO BID -
100020  |Paper, Construction--------- RIVERSIDE NO SUBS Assorted 18"x24", 50 sht/rm #103478 RM 33[NO BID - 4.02 132.66 [NO BID - NO BID - 4.50 148.50 5.72 188.76 | NO BID -
100023  |Paper, Drawing-12" x 18" Manila 60# APC # 612M RM 6[NO BID - 16.77 100.62 [NO BID - NO BID - 8.81 52.86 | NO BID - 30.37 182.22
100024  |Paper, Drawing-18" x 24" Manila 60# APC # 618M RM 13|NO BID - 35.43 460.59 [NO BID - NO BID - 17.62 229.06 | NO BID - 1.47 19.11
100025  |Paper, Drawing-12" x 18" White 80#, sulphite APC # 812W RM 55[NO BID - 20.65 1,135.75 |[NO BID - NO BID - 12.68 697.40 | NO BID - 1.47 80.85
100026  |Paper, Drawing-18" x 24" White 80#, sulphite APC # 818W RM 24[NO BID - 79.54 1,908.96 |NO BID - NO BID - 25.38 609.12 | NO BID - 1.47 35.28
100028 |Paper, Fadeless-12" x 18", Assorted BemisJason NO SUBS Assorted #5750-4 RM 46|NO BID - 6.97 320.62 [NO BID - NO BID - 3.50 161.00 | NO BID - 1.47 67.62
100030 |Paper, Fadeless-48" x 50" roll PACON NO SUBS Apple Green 5713-5 RL 12|NO BID - 12.74 152.88 [NO BID - NO BID - 10.42 125.04 | NO BID - 1.47 17.64
100031 |Paper, Fadeless-48" x 50" roll PACON NO SUBS Azure Blue 5716-5 RL 21[NO BID - 11.50 241.50 [NO BID - NO BID - 10.42 218.82 | NO BID - 2.21 46.41
100032  |Paper, Fadeless-48" x 50" roll PACON NO SUBS Black 5730-5 RL 30[NO BID - 13.74 412.20 [NO BID - NO BID - 10.42 312.60 | NO BID - 1.47 44.10
100033  |Paper, Fadeless-48" x 50" roll PACON NO SUBS Canary Yellow 5708-5 RL 10|NO BID - 12.94 129.40 [NO BID - NO BID - 10.42 104.20 | NO BID - 1.47 14.70
100034  |Paper, Fadeless-48" x 50" roll PACON NO SUBS Dark Yellow 5732-5 RL 18|NO BID - NO BID - __|NOBID - NO BID - 10.42 187.56 | NO BID - 1.47 26.46
100035  |Paper, Fadeless-48" x 50" roll PACON NO SUBS Deep Brown 5702-5 RL 13|NO BID - 13.50 175.50 [NO BID - NO BID - 10.42 135.46 | NO BID - 0.69 8.97
100036  |Paper, Fadeless-48" x 50" roll PACON NO SUBS Emerald Green 5714-5 RL 6|NO BID - 13.28 79.68 |NO BID - NO BID - 10.42 62.52 | NO BID - 1.47 8.82
100037 |Paper, Fadeless-48" x 50" roll PACON NO SUBS Flame Red 5703-5 RL 17|NO BID - 12.94 219.98 [NO BID - NO BID - 10.42 177.14 ] NO BID - 6.76 114.92
100038  |Paper, Fadeless-48" x 50' roll PACON NO SUBS Nile Green 5712-5 RL 7|NO BID - 12.65 88.55 INO BID - NO BID - 10.42 72.94 | NOBID - NO BID -
100039 |Paper, Fadeless-48" x 50" roll PACON NO SUBS Orange 5710-5 RL 15|NO BID - 13.28 199.20 [NO BID - NO BID - 10.42 156.30 | NO BID - 1.58 23.70
100040 |Paper, Fadeless-48" x 50" roll PACON NO SUBS Pink 5726-5 RL 6|NO BID - 13.50 81.00 |NO BID - NO BID - 10.42 62.52 | NO BID - 1.58 9.48
100041  |Paper, Fadeless-48" x 50" roll PACON NO SUBS Rich Blue 5718-5 RL 17|NO BID - 12.65 215.05 [NO BID - NO BID - 10.42 177.14 ] NO BID - 1.58 26.86
100042  |Paper, Fadeless-48" x 50" roll PACON NO SUBS White 5701-5 RL 19|NO BID - 14.04 266.76 [NO BID - NO BID - 2.33 44.27 | NO BID - 1.39 26.41
100044 |Paper, Finger Paint-16" x 22" #FP-100,#3205, or equal White PK 18|NO BID - 5.25 94.50 |NO BID - NO BID - 35.74 643.32 3.78 - 1.39 25.02
100046  |Paper, Mural-36" x 1100 roll, 50 Ib. Bemis Jason or equal R-474 Blue RL 3|NO BID - 50.09 150.27 |[NO BID - NO BID - 35.25 105.75 | NO BID - 1.47 4.41
100047 |Paper, Mural-36" x 1100 roll, 50 Ib. Bemis Jason or equal R-467 Brown RL 3|NO BID - 50.36 151.08 [NO BID - NO BID - 34.22 102.66 | NO BID - 1.47 4.41
100048  |Paper, Mural-36" x 1100 roll, 50 Ib. Bemis Jason or equal R-480 Green RL 3|NO BID - 66.88 200.64 [NO BID - NO BID - 38.91 116.73 | NO BID - 1.39 4.17
100049  |Paper, Mural-36" x 1100 roll, 50 Ib. Bemis Jason or equal R-460 Red RL 1|NO BID - 57.00 57.00 |NO BID - NO BID - 34.65 34.65 | NOBID - 1.47 1.47
100050 [Paper, Mural-36" x 1100 roll, 50 Ib. Bemis Jason or equal R-587 White RL 8[NO BID - 47.40 379.20 [NO BID - NO BID - 43.78 350.24 | NO BID - 1.58 12.64
100051  |[Paper, Mural-36" x 1100 roll, 50 Ib. Bemis Jason or equal R-484 Yellow RL 3|NO BID - 62.24 186.72 [NO BID - NO BID - 7.80 23.40 | NOBID - 1.39 4.17
100054  |Paper, Newsprint-18" x 24" APC #318-1or equal Art Unlined 3524 White RM 13|NO BID - 13.26 172.38 [NO BID - NO BID - 3.79 49.27 9.42 - 1.47 19.11
100057  |Paper, Tag Board-12" x 18", 125# Manila/Natural APC # 1212MC NO SUBS. RM 82[NO BID - 6.74 552.68 [NO BID - NO BID - 7.62 624.84 | NO BID - 1.55 127.10
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EXHIBIT "B"

VENDOR BID FORMS

BID #17-019 General Office, Paper, Art Supplies ART PAPER Company Name
QTY UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT UNIT TOTAL UNIT

Item # Description Line 1 Description Line 2 U/M|ORDER| COST COST UNIT COST | TOTAL COST | COST COST COST COST COST TOTAL COST | COST COST COST | TOTAL COST
100058 |Paper, Tag Board-18" x 24", 125# Manila/Natural APC # 1218MC NO SUBS. RM 25[NO BID - NO BID - |NOBID - NO BID - 3.79 94.75 | NOBID - 1.84 46.00
100059 |Paper, Tag Board-12" x 18", 125# White APC # 1212WP NO SUBS. RM 280|NO BID - NO BID - |NOBID - NO BID - 7.62 2,133.60 | NO BID - 1.49 417.20
100060 |Paper, Tag Board-18" x 24", 125# White APC # 1218WP NO SUBS. RM 53[NO BID - NO BID - |NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 3.71 196.63
100063 |Paper, Tissue-20" x 30" sheets Crystal Brand Or Equal 5410000 Rainbow PK 68[NO BID - 6.49 441.32 [NO BID - NO BID - 1.81 123.08 | NO BID - 8.73 593.64
100064 |Paper, Tissue-20" x 30" sheets Crystal Brand Or Equal 2246C00 Parade Blue PK 97(NO BID - 1.39 134.83 [NO BID - NO BID - 1.81 175.57 | NO BID - 17.45 1,692.65
100065 |Paper, Tissue-20" x 30" sheets Crystal Brand Or Equal 20300660 Apple Green PK 91[NO BID - 1.39 126.49 [NO BID - NO BID - 1.81 164.71 ] NO BID - 12.82 1,166.62
100066 |Paper, Tissue-20" x 30" sheets Crystal Brand Or Equal 2246400 Holly Green PK 95[NO BID - 1.39 132.05 [NO BID - NO BID - 1.81 171.95 ] NO BID - 25.76 2,447.20
100067  |Paper, Tissue-20" x 30" sheets Crystal Brand Or Equal 2241400 Orange PK 26[NO BID - 1.39 36.14 |NO BID - NO BID - 1.81 47.06 | NO BID - NO BID -

100068 |Paper, Tissue-20" x 30" sheets Crystal Brand Or Equal 2240200 Light Pink PK 22(NO BID - 1.39 30.58 |NO BID - NO BID - 1.81 39.82 | NOBID - 1.47 32.34
100069 |Paper, Tissue-20" x 30" sheets Crystal Brand Or Equal 2240400 Dark Pink PK 90[NO BID - 1.78 160.20 [NO BID - NO BID - 1.81 162.90 | NO BID - 7.25 652.50
100070 |Paper, Tissue-20" x 30" sheets Crystal Brand Or Equal 2243400 Black PK 9|NO BID - 1.39 12.51 [NO BID - NO BID - 1.81 16.29 | NO BID - 1.47 13.23
100071  |Paper, Tissue-20" x 30" sheets Crystal Brand Or Equal 2242400 Purple PK 81[NO BID - 1.78 144.18 [NO BID - NO BID - 1.81 146.61 | NO BID - 7.25 587.25
100072  |Paper, Tissue-20" x 30" sheets Crystal Brand Or Equal 2240800 Red PK 195[NO BID - 1.32 257.40 [NO BID - NO BID - 1.54 300.30 | NO BID - 7.25 1,413.75
100073  |Paper, Tissue-20" x 30" sheets Crystal Brand Or Equal 2201040 White PK 135[NO BID - 1.17 157.95 [NO BID - NO BID - 1.81 244.35 | NO BID - 7.25 978.75
100074 |Paper, Tissue-20" x 30" sheets Crystal Brand Or Equal 2241000 Yellow PK 48|NO BID - 1.39 66.72 INO BID - NO BID - 22.64 1,086.72 | NO BID - 7.25 348.00
100077  |Poster Board/Railroad-22"x28" Riverside, Pacon, or Equal 6-ply 4275 or 5482 Black CA 22[NO BID - 14.99 329.78 [INO BID - NO BID - 22.64 498.08 | NO BID - 7.25 159.50
100078 |Poster Board/Railroad-22"x28" Riverside, Pacon, or Equal 6-ply 4272 or 5493 Blue CA 9|NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 22.64 203.76 | NO BID - 7.25 65.25
100079 |Poster Board/Railroad-22"x28" Riverside, Pacon, or Equal 6-ply 4273 or 5462 Dk. Blue CA 10|{NO BID - 11.62 116.20 [NO BID - NO BID - 22.64 226.40 | NO BID - 6.22 62.20
100080 |Poster Board/Railroad-22"x28" Riverside, Pacon, or Equal 6-ply 4259 or 5494 Kelly(Holly) Green |CA 8|NO BID - 8.24 65.92 |[NO BID - NO BID - 22.64 181.12 | NO BID - 6.22 49.76
100081 |Poster Board/Railroad-22"x28" Riverside, Pacon, or Equal 6-ply 4264 or 5479 Orange CA 7|NO BID - 8.24 57.68 |[NO BID - NO BID - 22.64 158.48 | NO BID - 6.22 43.54
100082 |Poster Board/Railroad-22"x28" Riverside, Pacon, or Equal 6-ply 4265 or 5476 Red CA 15|NO BID - 8.24 123.60 [NO BID - NO BID - 22.64 339.60 | NO BID - 6.22 93.30
100083 |Poster Board/Railroad-22"x28" Riverside, Pacon, or Equal 6-ply 4277 or 5461 White CA 77[NO BID - 14.84 1,142.68 |NO BID - NO BID - 20.50 1,578.50 | NO BID - 5.09 391.93
100084 |Poster Board/Railroad-22"x28" Riverside, Pacon, or Equal 6-ply 4262 or 5473 Yellow CA 18|NO BID - 8.24 148.32 [NO BID - NO BID - 22.64 407.52 | NO BID - 6.10 109.80
100085 |Poster Board/Railroad-22"x28" Riverside, Pacon, or Equal 6-ply 4270 or 5497 Magenta CA 7|NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 22.64 158.48 | NO BID - 6.22 43.54
110004 [Brushes, Easel Round tip #6 DZ 1[NO BID - 2.73 2.73 [NO BID - NO BID - 1.16 1.16 | NOBID - 7.60 7.60
110005 [Brushes, Easel Flat tip #8, 1/2" DZ 6|NO BID - 6.61 39.66 |NO BID - NO BID - 1.97 11.82 | NO BID - 7.60 45.60
110007 |Brushes, Easel Watercolor #7, Crayloa or equal [DZ 5/NO BID - 2.32 11.60 [NO BID - NO BID - 1.24 6.20 | NO BID - 0.99 4.95
110009 |Brushes, Easel Flat 1" #22 or #178, Crayola or equal DZ 5|NO BID - 0.80 4.00 [INO BID - NO BID - 3.74 18.70 | NO BID - NO BID -

110013 [Cellophane, Art & Craft 20"x25', Roll #622175 Blue Hunt Bienfang or equal RL 2[NO BID - NO BID - |NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -

110016 |Cellophane, Art & Craft 20"x25', Roll #626175 Red Hunt Bienfang or equal RL 2[NO BID - NO BID - |NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -

110017 |Cellophane, Art & Craft 20"x25', Roll #621175 Amber Hunt Bienfang or equal RL 2[NO BID - NO BID - |NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -

110022 |Clay-4 Assorted Colors per box, #20 Kleen Klay NO SUBSTITUTES 1lb/bx BX 126|NO BID - NO BID - |NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -

110030 |Crayon Sharpener Crayola or equal EA 13|NO BID - 1.31 17.03 [NO BID - NO BID - 30.19 392.47 | NO BID - 0.64 8.32
110031 [Crayons-24 colors #241 Crayola only, NO SUBSTITUTES|BX 57[NO BID - 1.21 68.97 |INO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 1.29 73.53
110032  |Crayons, Primary 8 colors #38 Crayola only, NO SUBSTITUTES|BX 15|NO BID - 0.50 7.50 [NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 0.52 7.80
110033  |Crayons, 48 color/box, #48 Crayola only, NO SUBSTITUTES|BX 190[NO BID - 4.48 851.20 [NO BID - NO BID - 2.10 399.00 | NO BID - 2.48 471.20
110034 |Crayons, 8 colors/box #8F Crayola only, NO SUBSTITUTES|BX 31[NO BID - 1.43 44.33 [NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -

110035 |Crayons, 8 crayons/box #8 Crayola only, NO SUBSTITUTES|BX 135[NO BID - 0.50 67.50 |INO BID - NO BID - 0.40 54.00 | NOBID - NO BID -

110036  [Crayons, Crayola White NO SUBSTITUTES BX 14|NO BID - NO BID - |NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 1.17 16.38
110037  |Crayons, Crayola Black NO SUBSTITUTES BX 19|NO BID - 1.00 19.00 [NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 1.17 22.23
110038  |Crayons, Crayola Multicultural 16 colors/box, NO SUBSTITUTEYBX 39(NO BID - 0.60 23.40 INO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 0.52 20.28
110040 |Eraser, Gum, Art, 1"x 1"x 1" EA 273|NO BID - 0.36 98.28 |NO BID - NO BID - 0.11 31.12 | NOBID - 0.11 30.03
110042 |Felt Material-12"x 18" sealed plastic bag pkg, 12 pieces/pkg, Assorted Colors PK 21[NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 9.94 208.74
110043 |Felt Material-12"x 18" sealed plastic bag pkg, 12 pieces/pkg, Black PK 17|NO BID - NO BID - |INOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 3.45 58.65
110044 |Felt Material-12"x 18" sealed plastic bag pkg, 12 pieces/pkg, Blue PK 6|NO BID - NO BID - |NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 3.45 20.70
110045 |Felt Material-12"x 18" sealed plastic bag pkg. 12 pieces/pkg, Green PK 6/NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 3.45 20.70
110046  |Felt Material-12"x 18" sealed plastic bag pkg. 12 pieces/pkg, Orange PK 6|NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -
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EXHIBIT "B" VENDOR BID FORMS

BID #17-019 General Office, Paper, Art Supplies ART PAPER Company Name
QTY UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT UNIT TOTAL UNIT

Item # Description Line 1 Description Line 2 U/M|ORDER| COST COST UNIT COST | TOTAL COST | COST COST COST COST COST TOTAL COST | COST COST COST | TOTAL COST
110047 |Felt Material-12"x 18" sealed plastic bag pkg. 12 pieces/pkg, Red PK 23[NO BID - NO BID - |NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 3.45 79.35
110048 |Felt Material-12"x 18" sealed plastic bag pkg. 12 pieces/pkg, White PK 29(NO BID - NO BID - |NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 3.45 100.05
110049 |Felt Material-12"x 18" sealed plastic bag pkg. 12 pieces/pkg, Yellow PK 8|NO BID - NO BID - |NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 3.45 27.60
110060 |Foil, Tooling-12"x 25', soft aluminum one side colored 38 gauge Red RL 2|NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 10.57 21.14
110061 |Foil, Tooling-12"x 25', soft aluminum one side colored 38 gauge Silver RL 7|NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 8.73 61.11
110062 |Foil, Tooling-12"x 25', soft aluminum one side colored 38 gauge Gold RL 2|NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 10.57 21.14
110063 |Foil, Tooling-12"x 25', soft aluminum one side colored 38 guage Copper RL 2|NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 10.57 21.14
110064 |Foil, Tooling-12"x 25', soft aluminum one side colored 38 guage Blue RL 2|NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 10.57 21.14
110065 [Foil, Tooling-12"x 25', soft aluminum one side colored 38 guage Green RL 2|NO BID - NO BID - INOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 10.57 21.14
110067 |Fun-Tak, Blue Reusable Adhesive, DAP only NO SUBSTITUTES, 5/pkg. PK 1134[NO BID 15.66 17,758.44 |NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 0.96 1,088.64
110069 |Glue, Elmer's, 4 oz. #E-372NR, 48 per case NO SUBSTITUTES BT 710[NO BID 0.92 653.20 [NO BID - NO BID - 0.68 484.22 | NO BID - 36.00 25,560.00
110070  |Glue, Elmer's-16 oz. #E-371NR NO SUBSTITUTES BT 72[NO BID 1.47 105.84 [NO BID - NO BID - 2.71 195.12 ] NO BID - NO BID -

110075 |Ink, Printers, 4 oz,Water soluble Strokemaster or Speedball,Green|EA 4[NO BID NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 4.24 16.96
110076 |Ink, Printers, 4 oz, Water soluble Strokemaster or Speedball, OrandEA 12|NO BID NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 4.24 50.88
110077 |Ink, Printers, 4 oz, Water soluble Strokemaster or Speedball, YelloEA 22|NO BID NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 4.24 93.28
110079 |Ink, Printers, 4 oz, Water soluble Strokemaster or Speedball, Whitd EA 42[NO BID NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 4.24 178.08
110080 |Ink, Printers, 4 oz, Water soluble Strokemaster or Speedball, Viole EA 12|NO BID NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 4.24 50.88
110081 |Ink, Printers, 4 oz, Water soluble Strokemaster or Speedball, Turqu{EA 12|NO BID NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 4.24 50.88
110082 |Ink, Printers, 4 oz, Water soluble Strokemaster or Speedball, Red |EA 14|NO BID NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 4.24 59.36
110083 |Ink, Printers, 4 oz, Water soluble Strokemaster or Speedball, Black|EA 24|NO BID NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 4.24 101.76
110084 |Ink, Printers, 4 oz, Water soluble Strokemaster or Speedball, Blue |EA 12|NO BID NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 4.24 50.88
110085 |Ink, Printers, 4 oz, Water soluble Strokemaster or Speedball, Mage|EA 14|NO BID NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 4.24 59.36
110087  |Ink, India, Higgins, Black 1.0 oz. Bottle w/Dropper, NO SublEA 42|NO BID 2.81 118.02 [NO BID - NO BID - 2.22 93.24 | NOBID - NO BID -

110091  |[Laminating Film-Roller Laminator 25"x500' RL 541 12.00 [ 6,492.00 46.21 24,999.61 |[NO BID - NO BID - 11.26 6,091.66 | NO BID - 11.82 6,394.62
110093  [Markers, Crayola, Wide Tip, Tropical 8 color #07716 NO SUBSTITUTES ST 415|NO BID 2.80 1,162.00 |[NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 2.55 1,058.25
110094 [Markers, Crayola, Wide Tip, Classic 8 color #07708 NO SUBSTITUTES ST 377|NO BID NO BID - |NOBID - NO BID - 1.48 557.96 | NO BID - 1.96 738.92
110095  |Markers, Crayola, Wide Tip, Classic 8 color washable #07808 NO SUBSTITUTES ST 274|NO BID 2.37 649.38 [INO BID - NO BID - 1.86 509.64 | NO BID - 2.55 698.70
110102  |Paint, Finger-Crayola Black #1316-2-051, NO SUBSTITUTES|PT 4[NO BID 5.41 21.64 INO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 3.86 15.44
110103 [Paint, Finger-Crayola Blue #1316-2-042, NO SUBSTITUTES|PT 17|NO BID 5.41 91.97 INO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 3.86 65.62
110104 |Paint, Finger-Crayola Brown #1316-2-007, NO SUBSTITUTES|PT 4[NO BID 3.73 14.92 [NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 3.86 15.44
110105 |Paint, Finger-Crayola Green #1316-2-044, NO SUBSTITUTES|PT 8|NO BID 5.41 43.28 [NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 3.86 30.88
110106  |Paint, Finger-Crayola Red #1316-2-038, NO SUBSTITUTES|PT 18|NO BID 5.90 106.20 [NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 3.86 69.48
110107 |Paint, Finger-Crayola Yellow #1316-2-034, NO SUBSTITUTES|PT 19|NO BID 5.90 112.10 [NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 3.86 73.34
110110  |Paint, Tempra Cake Set, #809 Prange, NO SUBSTITUTES ST 42|NO BID NO BID - |NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 7.63 320.46
110111 [Paint, Tempera, Cake 1.5" X 1.5" X 5/8" Black, Prange, NO SUBSTITUTE{EA 2[NO BID NO BID - |NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -

110112 |Paint, Tempera, Cake 1.5" X 1.5" X 5/8" Blue, Prange, NO SUBSTITUTESEA 6|NO BID NO BID - [NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -

110113  |Paint, Tempera, Cake 1.5" X 1.5" X 5/8" Brown, Prange, NO SUBSTITUTHEA 2|NO BID NO BID - [NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -

110114 |Paint, Tempera, Cake 1.5" X 1.5" X 5/8" Green, Prange, NO SUBSTITUTHEA 2|NO BID NO BID - [NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -

110115 |Paint, Tempera, Cake 1.5" X 1.5" X 5/8" Orange, Prange, NO SUBSTITUTEA 2|NO BID NO BID - [NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -

110116  |Paint, Tempra, Cake 1.5" X 1.5" X 5/8" Red, Prange, NO SUBSTITUTES|EA 6|NO BID NO BID - [NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -

110117 [Paint, Tempra, Cake 1.5" X 1.5" X 5/8" Violet, Prange, NO SUBSTITUTE[EA 2|NO BID NO BID - [NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -

110118 |Paint, Tempra, Cake 1.5" X 1.5" X 5/8" White, Prange, NO SUBSTITUTE[EA 2|NO BID NO BID - [NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -

110119 |Paint, Tempra, Cake 1.5" X 1.5" X 5/8" Yellow, Prange, NO SUBSTITUTHEA 6|NO BID NO BID - [NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -

110122  |Paint, Tempra-Fluorescent Pink-Crayola, NO SUBSTITUTESPT 9|NO BID 2.07 18.63 [NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 5.96 53.64
110123  |Paint, Tempra-Fluorescent Red-Crayola, NO SUBSTITUTES|PT 12|NO BID 2.10 25.20 INO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 5.96 71.52
110124  |Paint, Tempra-Fluorescent Blue-Crayola, NO SUBSTITUTESPT 13|NO BID 2.47 32.11 INO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 5.96 77.48
110125  |Paint, Tempra-Fluorescent Green-Crayola, NO SUBSTITUTHPT 15|NO BID 2.12 31.80 [NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 5.96 89.40
110126 |Paint, Tempra-Fluorescent Yellow-Crayola, NO SUBSTITUTHPT 8|NO BID 2.08 16.64 [NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 5.96 47.68
110127 |Paint, Tempra-Fluorescent Chartreuse-Crayola, NO SUBSTI|PT 9|INO BID NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 5.96 53.64
110130 |Paint, Tempra, 32 oz. Black QT 44|NO BID 5.90 259.60 [NO BID - NO BID - 1.74 76.56 | NO BID - 1.85 81.40
110131 |Paint, Tempra, 32 oz. Blue QT 38[NO BID 5.90 224.20 [INO BID - NO BID - 1.74 66.12 | NO BID - 1.85 70.30
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EXHIBIT "B"

VENDOR BID FORMS

BID #17-019 General Office, Paper, Art Supplies ART PAPER Company Name
QTY UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT UNIT TOTAL UNIT

Item # Description Line 1 Description Line 2 U/M|ORDER| COST UNIT COST | TOTAL COST | COST COST COST COST COST TOTAL COST | COST COST COST | TOTAL COST
110132 [Paint, Tempra, 32 oz. Brown QT 8|NO BID 5.90 47.20 [NO BID - NO BID - 1.74 13.92 | NO BID - 1.85 14.80
110133 [Paint, Tempra, 32 oz. Green QT 20[NO BID 5.90 118.00 [NO BID - NO BID - 1.74 34.80 | NOBID - 1.85 37.00
110134 [Paint, Tempra, 32 oz. Magenta QT 8|NO BID 5.90 47.20 [NO BID - NO BID - 1.74 13.92 | NO BID - 1.85 14.80
110135 [Paint, Tempra, 32 oz. Orange QT 13|NO BID 5.90 76.70 INO BID - NO BID - 1.74 22.62 | NOBID - 1.85 24.05
110136 [Paint, Tempra, 32 oz. Red QT 42|NO BID 5.90 247.80 [NO BID - NO BID - 1.74 73.08 | NOBID - 1.85 77.70
110137 _ [Paint, Tempra, 32 oz. White QT 51[NO BID 5.90 300.90 [NO BID - NO BID - 1.74 88.74 | NOBID - 1.85 94.35
110138  |Paint, Tempra, 32 oz. Yellow QT 31[NO BID 5.90 182.90 [NO BID - NO BID - 1.74 53.94 | NOBID - 1.85 57.35
110141 |Paint, Tempra, 16 oz. Black PT 16|NO BID 1.52 24.32 INO BID - NO BID - 0.91 14.56 | NO BID - 1.08 17.28
110142  |Paint, Tempra, 16 oz. Blue PT 24[NO BID 1.52 36.48 [NO BID - NO BID - 0.91 21.84 | NOBID - 0.99 23.76
110143 |Paint, Tempra, 16 oz. Brown PT 9|NO BID 1.52 13.68 [NO BID - NO BID - 0.91 8.19 | NO BID - 0.99 8.91
110144  |Paint, Tempra, 16 oz. Gold PT 9|NO BID 1.60 14.40 [NO BID - NO BID - 1.18 10.62 | NO BID - 6.76 60.84
110145 [Paint, Tempra, 16 oz Green PT 34[NO BID 1.52 51.68 |NO BID - NO BID - 0.91 30.94 | NOBID - 1.08 36.72
110146  |Paint, Tempra, 16 oz. Magenta PT 8|NO BID 1.52 12.16 [NO BID - NO BID - 0.91 7.28 | NO BID - 0.99 7.92
110147 _ |Paint, Tempra, 16 oz. Orange PT 35[NO BID 1.52 53.20 [NO BID - NO BID - 0.91 31.85 | NOBID - 0.99 34.65
110148 |Paint, Tempra, 16 oz. Peach PT 10|NO BID 2.07 20.70 INO BID - NO BID - 0.91 9.10 | NO BID - 4.42 44.20
110149 |Paint, Tempra, 16 oz. Red PT 34[NO BID 1.52 51.68 |NO BID - NO BID - 0.91 30.94 | NOBID - 1.08 36.72
110150 |Paint, Tempra, 16 oz. Violet PT 32[NO BID 1.52 48.64 [NO BID - NO BID - 0.91 29.12 | NOBID - 0.99 31.68
110151  |Paint, Tempra, 16 oz. White PT 69(NO BID 1.52 104.88 [NO BID - NO BID - 0.91 62.79 | NOBID - 1.08 74.52
110152  |Paint, Tempra, 16 oz. Turquoise PT 19|NO BID 1.52 28.88 INO BID - NO BID - 0.91 17.29 | NO BID - 0.99 18.81
110153  |Paint, Tempra, 16 oz. Yellow PT 36[NO BID 1.52 54.72 |INO BID - NO BID - 0.91 32.76 | NOBID - 0.99 35.64
110156  |Paste, School-Elmer's (paper mache), 2 oz pkg NO SUBSTITUTES QT 2[NO BID NO BID - |NOBID - NO BID - 2.12 4.24 | NOBID - NO BID -

110158 |Pastels, Weber Costello (chalks) 24 color, Alphacolor, NO SUBSTI|BX 6|NO BID NO BID - |NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -

110159 |Pastels, QOil, Crayola class pack 366 class pack, NO SUBSTITUTHBX 23[NO BID 27.13 623.99 [INO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 2.47 56.81
110160 |Pastels, Qil, Crayola 28 color, NO SUBSTITUTES BX 77[NO BID 2.38 183.26 [NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 3.32 255.64
110162  |Pencil, Charcoal, Medium, #4B #SAX 320-2041, or equal EA 45|NO BID NO BID - |NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 0.54 24.30
110164  |Pencils, Colored, 12 Colors Crayola #4012E, NO SUBSTITUTST 238|NO BID 1.44 342.72 INO BID - NO BID - 1.20 285.60 | NO BID - 1.54 366.52
110165  |Pencils, Colored, 24 Colors Crayola #4024, NO SUBSTITUTHST 297|NO BID 2.81 834.57 INO BID - NO BID - 2.39 709.83 | NO BID - 2.92 867.24
110171 |Scratch Board, Foam (Scratch-Art brand) White 9x12 (PK 41|NO BID 16.17 662.97 [INO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -

110175  |Water Colors, Prange #8, 8 colors/box, #08000 w/brush, NQST 206|NO BID 2.00 412.00 [NO BID - NO BID - 1.29 265.74 | NO BID - 2.18 449.08
110176 |Water Colors, Prange #8 Black 1/2 pan refills #ACC8-16BLA, NO[EA 84[NO BID NO BID - |NOBID - NO BID - 0.16 13.27 | NO BID - 0.24 20.16
110177 |Water Colors, Prange #8, Blue 1/2 pan refill #ACC8-16BLU, NO {EA 563|NO BID NO BID - |NOBID - NO BID - 0.16 88.95 | NOBID - 0.24 135.12
110178  |Water Colors, Prange #8 Brown 1/2 pan refills #ACC8-16BRO, NQEA 124[NO BID NO BID - |NOBID - NO BID - 0.16 19.59 | NO BID - 0.24 29.76
110179  |Water Colors, Prange #8, Green 1/2 pan refills #ACC8-16GRE, NQEA 237|NO BID NO BID - |NOBID - NO BID - 0.16 37.45 | NOBID - 0.24 56.88
110180 |Water Colors, Prange #8,0range 1/2 pan refills #ACC8-160RA, NQEA 146(NO BID NO BID - |NOBID - NO BID - 0.16 23.07 | NOBID - 0.24 35.04
110181  |Water Colors, Prange #8, Red 1/2 pan refills #ACC8-16RED, NQEA 158/NO BID NO BID - |NOBID - NO BID - 0.16 24.96 | NOBID - 0.24 37.92
110182  |Water Colors, Prange #8,Violet 1/2 pan refills #ACC8-16VIO, NO |EA 230|NO BID NO BID - |NOBID - NO BID - 0.16 36.34 | NOBID - 0.24 55.20
110183  |Water Colors, Prange #8,Yellow 1/2 pan refills #ACC8-16YEL, NO|EA 332|NO BID NO BID - |NOBID - NO BID - 0.16 52.46 | NO BID - 0.24 79.68
110213 [Xacto Blade, #11 #X-21112, or equal PK 34[NO BID 0.18 5.95 [NO BID - NO BID - 0.36 12.24 | NO BID - 0.17 5.94
110214 [Xacto Knives, #11 Handle w/one Blade #X-3288, or equal EA 36[NO BID 2.13 76.68 |NO BID - NO BID - 0.47 16.92 | NO BID - 1.88 67.68
120006 |Headphones Hamilton Elct.Mod.#HA2 No Substitutes EA 1600[NO BID 5.34 8,544.00 | NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -

120008 |Labels, for Laser Printer, AVERY #5160/equal 8-1/2" x 11" Sheet, 3 Across, 30 gBX 54|NO BID 45.32 2,447.28 | NO BID - NO BID - 4.34 234.36 | NO BID - 22.55 1,217.70
120015 [Labels, for Copiers, AVERY #5351 or equal 8-1/2"x 11" Sheet 3 Across, 33 pgBX 25[NO BID 18.19 454.75 [ NO BID - NO BID - 4.66 116.50 | NO BID - 4.56 114.00
120030 |Cartridge, Black for HP1200 Laser Printer HPC-7115-A EA 316|NO BID 78.26 24,730.16 66.65 | 21,061.40 15.00 4,740.00 | NO BID - NO BID - 74.20 23,447.20
120032  |HP-2200 Series Printers CYAN HP-11 BLUE, #C-4836-AN EA 2[NO BID 42.80 85.60 31.90 63.80 3.80 7.60 | NO BID - NO BID - 43.99 87.98
120033  |HP-2200 Series Printers (RED) HP-11 MAGENTA, #C-4837-AN |EA 4[NO BID 42.79 171.16 31.90 127.60 3.80 15.20 [ NO BID - NO BID - 43.99 175.96
120034 |HP-2200 Series Printers YELLOW HP-11 YELLOW, #C-4838-AN _ |EA 3|NO BID 42.80 128.40 31.90 95.70 3.80 11.40 [ NO BID - NO BID - 43.99 131.97
120037  |Batteries, "AA" for remote (24-Pack) Alakline Eveready NO {PK 99(NO BID 8.98 889.02 | NO BID - NO BID - 8.61 852.39 | NO BID - 20.94 2,073.06
120039 |Batteries, "AAA" for remotes (16-Pack) Alkaline, Eveready NO|PK 77[NO BID 6.45 496.65 [ NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 12.10 931.70
120040 |Batteries, 9V for remotes (2-Pack) Alkaline, Eveready NO §PK 89(NO BID 8.29 737.81 | NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 13.27 1,181.03
120057  |Ctrdg,for LEXMARK E2400n Printer. Part #24035SA, Laserprinter EA 22(NO BID 121.22 2,666.84 103.65 | 2,280.30 35.00 770.00 [ NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -

120058  |Ctrdg,for LEXMARK E250dn Printer. Part #250A11A Laserprinter EA 33[NO BID 103.10 3,402.30 96.70 | 3,191.10 35.00 1,155.00 | NO BID - NO BID - 105.76 3,490.08
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EXHIBIT "B" VENDOR BID FORMS

BID #17-019 General Office, Paper, Art Supplies ART PAPER Company Name
QTY UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT UNIT TOTAL UNIT
Item # Description Line 1 Description Line 2 U/M|ORDER| COST COST UNIT COST | TOTAL COST | COST COST COST COST COST TOTAL COST | COST COST COST | TOTAL COST
120059 [Black Q2613X Ctg. For HP-1300 Laserprinter EA 1|NO BID 113.83 113.83 80.50 80.50 17.00 17.00 [ NO BID - NO BID - 109.22 109.22
120060 |Ctrdg HP-2600 Laserprinter, Black Part #Q-6000A EA 15|NO BID 84.43 1,266.45 59.75 896.25 20.00 300.00 [ NO BID - NO BID - 79.84 1,197.60
120061 |Ctrdg HP-2600 Laserprinter, Cyan(Blue) Part #Q-6001A EA 14|NO BID 92.17 1,290.38 65.25 913.50 20.00 280.00 [ NO BID - NO BID - 87.97 1,231.58
120062 |Ctrdg HP-2600 Laserprinter, Magenta(Red) Part #Q-6003A EA 12|NO BID 92.20 1,106.40 65.25 783.00 20.00 240.00 [ NO BID - NO BID - 88.26 1,059.12
120063  |Ctrdg HP-2600 Laserprinter,Yellow Part #Q-6002A EA 7|NO BID 92.20 645.40 65.25 456.75 20.00 140.00 | NO BID - NO BID - 87.99 615.93
120064 |Ctrdg for LEXMARK E260n Printer Part # E260A11A EA 32[NO BID 100.13 3,204.16 94.00 | 3,008.00 46.00 1,472.00 | NO BID - NO BID - 102.74 3,287.68
120065 |Ctrdg for HP 401n HP 80A / CF280A EA 142|NO BID NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - -
120066  |Ctrdg for HP M451dn, Black HP CE410A EA 74[NO BID NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - -
120067  |Ctrdg for HP M451dn, Cyan HP CE411A EA 65[NO BID NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - -
120068 |Ctrdg for HP M451dn, Magenta HP CE413A EA 58|NO BID NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - -
120069 |Ctrdg for HP M451dn, Yellow HP CE412A EA 65[NO BID NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - -
130004 |Book Ends. 9", Black, steel 2 eachin a set PR 9|NO BID 4.73 42.57 [ NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 1.92 17.28
130013  |Chart Pad Holder, #9890 Adjustable, No Substitutes EA 2[NO BID NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -
130014  |Cleaner,White Board only, pump spray Sanford #81803, 8 oz. NO SUBS|BT 99(NO BID 2.49 246.51 [ NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 2.12 209.88
130016  |Clips, Paper,Standard, steel Size 1-1/4" BX 1431[NO BID 1.78 2,547.18 | NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 0.14 200.34
130017 _ |Clips, Paper,Jumbo, steel Size 2" BX 2207|NO BID 4.50 9,931.50 | NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 0.41 904.87
130018 |Correction Fluid, Vapor-Safe White Non-Toxic Water Base Bic #/VOFWB12 NO SUBSTITUTES EA 553|NO BID 14.68 8,118.04 [ NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -
130021  |Envelopes,Manila,6"x9" booklet Side Opening W/O Clasp,500/bo¥BX 92(NO BID NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 15.79 1,452.68
130022  |Envelopes,Manila,9"x12" booklet Side Opening,W/O Clasp,500/bo¥BX 15|NO BID NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 27.56 413.40
130023  |Envelopes,Manila,10"x13" booklet Side Opening,W/O Clasp,500/bo¥BX 19|NO BID NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 31.00 589.00
130024  |Envelopes,White Bond #6-3/4 24#,Sulphite (Standard) no windo|[BX 12|NO BID 6.60 79.20 | NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 6.84 82.08
130025 |Envelopes,White, Bond #10 24# Sulphite,(Standard) no windo|[BX 14|NO BID 2.46 34.44 | NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 1.54 21.53
130028 |Eraser, White Board Claridge LCS 227, NO SUBSTITUEA 477|NO BID NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -
130029 |Eraser, Chalkboard Standard Felt, 6"x2-1/2", General #5/equal |[EA 54[NO BID 2.32 125.28 [ NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 0.67 36.18
130030 |Eraser, Chalkboard Cleaner Sponge Rubber Finney #1200 only NO SUBS EA 17|NO BID NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -
130031 |Eraser, Pencil, Pink, Rubber Papermate Pink Pearl, NO SUBS|EA 715|NO BID 1.15 822.25 | NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 0.03 21.45
130033 |Fasteners, Round Head 1/2", #2, 100/box BX 71[NO BID 1.12 79.52 | NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 0.43 30.53
130034 |Fasteners, Round head 1", #4, 100/box BX 80[NO BID 7.53 602.40 | NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 0.57 45.60
130035 |[File Folders, Hanging 1/5 cut Clear tab, Letter size, 25/box BX 162[NO BID 4.44 719.28 | NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 3.89 630.18
130036 |File Folders, Hanging 1/5 cut Clear tab, Legal size, 25/box BX 17|NO BID 5.66 96.22 | NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 5.30 90.10
130037  [File Folders, Manila, 1/3 cut Letter size, 100/box BX 440|NO BID 7.00 3,080.00 | NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 5.03 2,213.20
130038 |[File Folders, Manila, 1/3 cut Legal Size, 100/box BX 23[NO BID 6.04 138.92 [ NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 6.91 158.93
130039 |[File Pocket Folders, Manila Letter size, 1-1/2", 50/box BX 22(NO BID 13.68 300.96 | NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -
130040 |File Pocket Folders, Manila Legal Size, 1-1/2", 50/box BX 15|NO BID 16.89 253.35 | NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -
130043 |Flash Cards, Practice, Nifty or equal 2"x3" White (Plain), BX 32[NO BID NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -
130044 |Index Cards, 110#, Stock 3"x5" ruled, 1,000/box, APC#IND]BX 127[NO BID 1.27 161.29 [ NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 3.30 419.10
130045 |Index Cards, 110#, Stock 4"x6" ruled, 1,000/box, APC# INDBX 81[NO BID 2.12 171.72 [ NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 5.40 437.40
130046 |Index Cards, 110#, Stock 5"x8" ruled, 500/box, APC# IND§BX 74[NO BID 0.70 51.80 | NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 4.45 329.30
130049 |Labels, Color Coding, 3/4" Dot 1000/pkg Assorted Colors (universal #4010{PK 51[NO BID 2.74 139.74 [ NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 3.26 166.26
130051  [Marker, Felt Tip, Chisel Point Permanent Non-Toxic #95007 Black Sax RedEA 1724[NO BID 0.72 1,244.73 | NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 5.83 10,050.92
130052  |Marker, Felt Tip, Chisel Point Permanent Non-Toxic #95008 Blue Sax Redi{EA 473|NO BID 0.72 341.98 | NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -
130053 |Marker, Felt Tip, Chisel Point Permanent Non-Toxic #95004 Green Sax Re{EA 419(NO BID NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -
130054  [Marker, Felt Tip, Chisel Point Permanent Non-Toxic #95001 Red Sax RedifEA 482|NO BID 0.72 348.00 | NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -
130055  [Marker, Highlighter, Green Sanford Major Accent, #25026 NQEA 927|NO BID 0.48 440.33 [ NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 4.97 4,607.19
130056  |Marker, Highlighter, Pink Sanford Major Accent, #25009 NQEA 813|NO BID 0.48 386.18 | NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 4.97 4,040.61
130057  [Marker, Highlighter, Yellow Sanford Major Accent, #25005 NQEA 1138[NO BID 0.48 540.55 | NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 4.97 5,655.86
130058 |Marker, Highlighter, Blue Sanford Major Accent, #25010 NQEA 765|NO BID 0.48 363.38 | NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 4.97 3,802.05
130060 |[Marker, For White Board Only, Black Expo 2, No Substitutes #80001 C[EA 3639|NO BID 0.05 172.85 [ NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 10.06 36,608.34
130061 |[Marker, For White Board Only,Blue Expo 2, No Substitutes #80003 C[EA 2800|NO BID 0.96 2,682.40 | NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 10.06 28,168.00
130062  |Marker, For White Board Only,Green Expo 2, No Substitutes #80004 C[EA 2272|NO BID 0.96 2,176.58 | NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 10.06 22,856.32
130063  [Marker, For White Board Only,Red Expo 2, No Substitutes #80002 C|[EA 2230|NO BID 0.96 2,136.34 | NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 10.06 22,433.80
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EXHIBIT "B"

VENDOR BID FORMS

BID #17-019 General Office, Paper, Art Supplies ART PAPER Company Name
QTY UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT UNIT TOTAL UNIT

Item # Description Line 1 Description Line 2 U/M|ORDER| COST COST UNIT COST | TOTAL COST | COST COST COST COST COST TOTAL COST | COST COST COST | TOTAL COST
130064 |Marker, For Overhead Projector Water sol Sanford Vis-A Vis, NO SUBS Bla{EA 305|NO BID - 0.97 295.85 [ NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 9.93 3,028.65
130065 |Marker, For Overhead Projector Water sol Sanford Vis-A-Vis, NO SUBS BIudEA 230|NO BID - 0.97 223.56 [ NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 9.93 2,283.90
130066 |Marker, For Overhead Projector Water sol Sanford Vis-A-Vis, NO SUBS ReqEA 126/NO BID - 0.97 122.22 [ NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 9.93 1,251.18
130067 |Marker, For Overhead Projector Water sol Sanford Vis-A-Vis, NO SUBS GrelEA 181[NO BID - 0.98 176.48 | NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 9.93 1,797.33
130068 |Marker, For Overhead Projector Permanent Sanford Vis-A-Vis, NO SUBS 4/sdST 74|NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -

130069 [Marker, For Overhead Projector Water sol Sanford Vis-A-Vis, NO SUBS 4/sqST 90(NO BID - 3.91 351.90 | NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 3.34 300.60
130071  [Marker, Sanford Sharpie, Non-Toxic,Black Permanent, Fine Point. NO SUBSEA 3184|NO BID - 0.69 2,190.59 | NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 713 22,701.92
130072 |Marker, Sanford Sharpie, Non-Toxic,Black Permanent, Extra Fine Point NO 4EA 2389|NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 713 17,033.57
130073  [Paper, Contact, Clear,18"x25'yd., roll Contact Brand #9995, NO SUBS |RL 33[NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -

130074 |Pencil, Marking Blue, Fine, no eraser (Wood, Grading)Color Check, EmDZ 2|NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -

130075 |Pencil, Marking Red, Fine, no eraser (Wood, Grading)Color Check, EmDZ 3|NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -

130076  |Pencil, Primary Large #2 1/2" Diameter, for Primary grades|DZ 111|NO BID - 3.06 339.66 | NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 1.34 148.74
130077 |Pencil, #2 Lead Pencil, w/eraser, American, Dixon Oriole, or Berol Ensign, NO SUBSTITUTES DZ 3314|NO BID - 1.48 4,904.72 | NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 0.96 3,181.44
130078  |Pens, Medium Ball Point BLACK Non-Retractable, BIC, #20119 NqDZ 757|NO BID - 0.91 688.87 | NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 0.92 696.44
130079 |Pens, Medium Ball Point RED Non-Retractable, BIC, #20118 NqDZ 261|NO BID - 1.58 412.38 [ NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 0.92 240.12
130080 |Pens, Medium Ball Point BLUE Non-Retractable, BIC, #20120 NqDZ 458|NO BID - 1.45 664.10 | NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 0.92 421.36
130082 |Pins, Straight RL 12|NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -

130085 |Plastic Bindings, Ibico, 19 ring or equal Black, 1/4" E14BK, 100/box BX 12 2.37 28.44 3.34 40.08 [ NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 1.42 17.04
130086 |Plastic Bindings, Ibico, 19 ring or equal Black, 3/8" E38BK. 100/box BX 33 3.25 107.25 4.18 137.94 [ NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 1.97 65.01
130087 |Plastic Bindings, Ibico, 19 ring or equal Black, 1/2" E12BK, 100/box BX 23 417 95.91 6.32 145.36 [ NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 2.58 59.34
130088 |Plastic Bindings, Ibico, 19 ring or equal Black, 3/4" E34BK, 100/box BX 7 7.37 51.59 10.83 75.81 | NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 4.72 33.04
130090 |Post It Notes 34-120 (#6539) Yellow 1-1/2"x2", Highland 3M NO SUBYPK 288[NO BID - 1.20 345.60 | NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 1.20 345.60
130091 [Post It Notes 34-330 (#6549) Yellow 3"x3", Highland 3M NO SUBSTIT|PK 319|NO BID - 2.59 826.21 | NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 2.62 835.78
130092 |Post It Notes 34-350 (#6559)Yellow 3"x5", Highland 3M NO SUBSTIT|PK 145[NO BID - 3.98 577.10 | NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 3.72 539.40
130093  |Pop Up Post It Notes 3-M #R330AN Assorted Neon Colors NO SUBSTPK 67(NO BID - 10.86 727.62 | NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 11.52 771.84
130094 |Post It, Pad, 3"x3" (Special) Blue, 3M NO SUBSTITUTES PD 42|NO BID - 4.70 197.40 [ NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -

130095 |Post It, Pad, 3"x3" (Special) Pink, 3M NO SUBSTITUTES PD 149(NO BID - 4.70 700.30 | NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -

130096 |Post It, Pad 3M, 1-1/2"x2" #653RP Yellow, NO SUBSTITUTES PK 50[NO BID - 4.23 211.50 [ NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 4.52 226.00
130097 |Post It, Pad 3M, 3"x3" #654RP Yellow, NO SUBSTITUTES PK 158|NO BID - 10.28 1,624.24 | NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 10.73 1,695.34
130098 |Post It, Pad 3M 3"x5" #655RP Yellow, NO SUBSTITUTES PK 44|NO BID - 13.56 596.64 | NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 14.01 616.44
130099 |Punch, Paper 1/4" Diameter hole W/Paper Catcher EA 31[NO BID - 7.11 220.41 | NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 0.38 11.78
130102  |Rubber Bands, Arco #54 or equal Assorted Sized, 1/4 Ib PK PK 72[NO BID - 0.77 55.44 | NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 0.66 47.52
130103  |Rubber Bands, Arco #32 or equal One size 1/8"x3", 1/4 Ib PK PK 60[NO BID - 2.80 168.00 [ NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 0.66 39.60
130104 |Rubber Bands, Arco #64 or equal One size 1/4"x3", 1/4 |b PK PK 112|NO BID - 2.80 313.60 | NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -

130105 [Scissors, Blunt 4" Ambidextrious plastic handle, Fiskars, NO SUBS EA 59(NO BID - 2.36 139.24 [ NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -

130106 |Scissors, Pointed 5" Ambidextrious plastic handle, Fiskars, NO SUBS EA 360[NO BID - 2.36 849.60 | NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 1.32 475.20
130108 |Scissors, Teachers, 10",Stainless Steel Fiskars #101-C Ambidextrous,Pla|EA 207|NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -

130111 [Sentence Strips, White,1.5"x3/4"ruling 3"x24" APC# 9763 or Equal, 100 {PK 238|NO BID - 1.78 423.64 [ NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 1.87 445.06
130113 [Sharpener, Pencil Boston K.S. Nickel #1031, No Substitutes EA 74[NO BID - 9.97 737.78 | NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 6.54 483.96
130114 [Sharpener, Pencil Boston K.S. Metal Cover Only Boston K.S. #1(EA 13|NO BID - 10.31 134.03 [ NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 6.54 85.02
130116  |Stamp Pad, 2-3/4"x4-1/4" Black EA 19|NO BID - 2.31 43.89 [ NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 0.28 5.32
130117  |Stamp Pad, 2-3/4"x4-1/4" Red EA 17|NO BID - 1.84 31.28 | NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 0.28 4.76
130118  [Stamp Pad Inker, Sanford, RED, 2 fl. oz. Bottle, #58702 or Equal EA 12|NO BID - 1.04 12.48 [ NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 1.69 20.28
130119  [Stamp Pad Inker, Sanford, BLACK, 2 fl. oz. Bottle, #58701 or Equal EA 24[NO BID - 1.04 24.96 | NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 1.69 40.56
130121 |Staple Remover Standard or equal EA 86[NO BID - 0.35 30.10 | NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 0.20 17.20
130122  |Staples, Wire, 500 Standard Size Swingline #SF-1 NO SUBSTITUT|BX 705|NO BID - 1.08 761.40 | NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -

130123 [Stapler, Swingline #711 NO SUBSTITUTES Black Small Desktop EA 33[NO BID - 12.97 428.01 [ NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 7.66 252.78
130124 [Stapler, Swingline #747 NO SUBSTITUTES Black Large Desktop (Office) EA 155|NO BID - 10.59 1,641.45 | NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 10.11 1,567.05
130129 |Tacks, Thumb,steel 100/box BX 81[NO BID - 0.25 20.25 | NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 0.54 43.74
130130 |Tape, Adding Machine 2 1/4"x250' White 3 1/2: Dia.roll, Sulphite RL 30[NO BID - 0.85 25.50 | NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 0.45 13.38
130131 |Tape, Transparent, Cellophane 3M #600, 1/2"x1296' (12 Rolls/Pk|EA 135[NO BID - 1.32 178.20 [ NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 15.96 2,154.60
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EXHIBIT "B"

VENDOR BID FORMS

BID #17-019 General Office, Paper, Art Supplies ART PAPER Company Name
QTY UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT UNIT TOTAL UNIT

Item # Description Line 1 Description Line 2 U/M|ORDER| COST COST UNIT COST | TOTAL COST | COST COST COST COST COST TOTAL COST | COST COST COST | TOTAL COST
130132 [Tape, Transparent, Cellophane 3M #600, 3/4"x1296' (12 Rolls/Pk|EA 1490|NO BID - 1.38 2,060.67 | NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 21.06 31,379.40
130134 [Tape Dispensers 1/2" 3M or equal Smoke 12 eal/bx EA 38|NO BID - 1.26 47.69 [ NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 0.62 23.56
130135 [Tape Dispensers 3/4" 3M or equal #H-127 Smoke 12 edEA 503|NO BID - 1.45 726.84 | NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 0.62 311.86
130138 [Tape, Masking 1/2" 3M #234, 72 per case NO SUBSTRL 189|NO BID - 5.20 983.18 | NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 2.76 521.64
130139 [Tape, Masking 3/4" 3M #234, 48 per case NO SUBSTRL 593|NO BID - 7.05 4,180.06 [ NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 3.68 2,182.24
130140 [Tape, Masking 2" 3M #234, 24 per case NO SUBSTRL 1427|NO BID - 14.30 20,408.95 [ NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 9.24 13,185.48
130141 [Tape, Poly,w/o Paper Backing 3-M #845 1-1/2"x15 yds. NO SUBSTITUTEYRL 20|NO BID - 3.76 75.20 | NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 3.17 63.40
130142 [Tape, Poly,w/o Paper Backing 3-M #845 2"x15 yds. NO SUBSTITUTES |RL 71|NO BID - 4.07 288.97 [ NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 4.20 298.20
130143 [Tape, Poly,w/o Paper Backing 3-M #845 3"x15 yds. NO SUBSTITUTES [RL 17[NO BID - 6.22 105.74 [ NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 6.41 108.97
130144  [Tape, Poly.w/o Paper Backing 3-M #845 4"x15 yds. NO SUBSTITUTES |RL 22|NO BID - 12.95 284.90 | NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 8.45 185.90
130145 [Tape, Magic,See-Thru 3-M #810 1/2"x1296' NO SUBSTITUTES [RL 196[NO BID - 1.99 390.04 | NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 3.17 621.32
130146 [Tape, Magic, See-Thru 3-M #810 3/4"x1296' NO SUBSTITUTES |RL 761|NO BID - 7.59 5,775.99 | NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 11.99 9,124.39
130151 [Calendar, School, 12 Month Blue Nat'l, July 1-June 30 EA 80|NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 3.57 285.60
130153 [Grade Book, Teacher's Blue, #910-8LP, Supreme, NO SUEA 68|NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -

130154 [Plan Book, Teacher's Binders #920,Waverly, 6-ring, NQEA 13[NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -

130155  [Plan Book Refills, Teacher's #610 for Waverly 6-ring Binder, N[EA 155|NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -

130160 _ [Transparency, For Copiers 3M-PP-220, 8-1/2"x11", NO SUB{BX 1[NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -

130162 [Twine, Protek Pak USA made test breaking 38lbs.453 ft 16 ply Kleanties #36 |RL 20|NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -

130171 [Yardstick Wescott #R620 or equal w/Rubbg EA 14[NO BID - 3.62 50.68 | NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 0.59 8.26
140002 [Paper, Graph, 1/4" Squares 8 1/2"x11" #116 White, B&J #108 or equal RM 120|NO BID - 7.36 883.20 | NO BID - NO BID - 2.76 331.20 | NOBID - 2.25 270.00
140003 [Paper, Graph, 1/2" Squares 8 1/2"x11" #118 White, B&J #216 or equal RM 104[NO BID - 7.36 765.44 | NO BID - NO BID - 2.89 300.56 | NO BID - 2.68 278.72
140004  [Paper, Graph, 1" Squares 8 1/2"x11" #811/12s, White RM 26|NO BID - 7.36 191.36 [ NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 2.68 69.68
140005 [Paper, Dual Purpose/Xerographic 20#, 11"x17" #4 Grade Mill, WHITE RM 313|NO BID - 7.96 2,491.48 | NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 34.76 10,879.88
140006 [Cardstock,Vellum Bristol Cover or equal 8 1/2"x11" 67 Ibs #26000 Blue RM 304|NO BID - 4.55 1,383.20 [ NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 5.87 1,784.48
140007 _ [Cardstock,Vellum Bristol Cover or equal 8 1/2"x11" 67 Ibs #36000 Canary RM 368|NO BID - 4.47 1,644.96 [ NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 5.87 2,160.16
140008  [Cardstock,Vellum Bristol Cover or equal 8 1/2"x11" 67 Ibs #86000 Goldenrod RM 158[NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 7.72 1,219.76
140009  [Cardstock,Vellum Bristol Cover or equal 8 1/2"x11" 67 Ibs #46000 Green RM 301|NO BID - 4.70 1,414.70 [ NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 5.87 1,766.87
140010 _ [Cardstock,Vellum Bristol Cover or equal 8 1/2"x11" 67 Ibs #76000 Pink RM 187[NO BID - 4.41 824.67 | NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 7.72 1,443.64
140011 [Cardstock,Vellum Bristol Cover or equal 8 1/2"x11" 67 Ibs #16000 White RM 640[NO BID - 4.25 2,720.00 | NO BID - NO BID - NO BID NO BID - 5.65 3,616.00
140032 [Paper, Newsprint 18"x12" Sub 32 Heading,3/4"Ruling(#8-12) White |RM 0|NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -

140033 [Paper, Newsprint,18"x12" Sub 32 3/4"x3/8" Alternt.Rule (#7-12) Wh|RM 0|NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -

140034  [Paper, Newsprint,18"x12" Sub 32 1" Ruling (#1-12) White RM 0|NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -

140035 [Paper, Newsprint,18"x12" Sub 32 1" Ruling (#2-12) White RM 0|NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -

140042 [Paper, Penmanship 8"x10-1/2" Smooth (#4-56) White RM 38|NO BID - 2.14 81.32 | NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -

140043 _ [Paper, Primary Chart,24"x36" Sub 32,1" Ruled Lines, White EA 191|NO BID - 7.30 1,394.30 [ NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 4.26 813.66
140044 [Paper, Easel Pad, 34"x27" 1" Square, Graph PD 72|NO BID - 52.31 3,766.32 | NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 22.33 1,607.76
140046 [Paper, Story Zaner Bloser #140190 or equal _[RM 69|NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 3.46 238.74
140047 _ [Paper, Handwriting Zaner Bloser #0-A 140010 or eqRM 0|NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -

140048  [Paper, Handwriting Zaner Bloser #1-A 140011-8 or eRM 0|NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -

140049  [Paper, Handwriting Zaner Bloser #1 140001 or equal [RM 14[NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 1.77 24.78
140050 |Paper, Handwriting Zaner Bloser #2 140170 or equal |RM 3|NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 1.77 5.31
140052  [Paper, Handwriting Zaner Bloser #3 140142 or equal [RM 22|NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 1.77 38.94
140055  [Paper, Legal Pad, Yellow Only 50 Shts/Pad 8 1/2"x11 3/4" PD 589|NO BID - 9.91 5,836.99 | NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 5.36 3,157.04
140012** [Paper, Dual Purpose/Xerographic 8-1/2"x11" 20# Blue RM 779|NO BID - 4.09 3,186.11 | NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 3.71 2,890.09
140013** [Paper, Dual Purpose/Xerographic 8-1/2"x11" 20# Canary RM 1136|NO BID - 4.09 4,646.24 [ NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 3.71 4,214.56
140014** [Paper, Dual Purpose/Xerographic 8-1/2"x11" 20# Goldenrod RM 483[NO BID - 4.09 1,975.47 [ NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 3.71 1,791.93
140015** [Paper, Dual Purpose/Xerographic 8-1/2"x11" 20# Green RM 796|NO BID - 4.09 3,255.64 | NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 3.71 2,953.16
140016** [Paper, Dual Purpose/Xerographic 8-1/2"x11" 20# Pink RM 457[NO BID - 4.09 1,869.13 [ NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 3.71 1,695.47
140017** [Paper, Dual Purpose/Xerographic 8-1/2"x11" 20# Salmon RM 295[NO BID - 4.09 1,206.55 [ NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 3.71 1,094.45
140019** [Paper, Dual Purpose/Xerographic 8-1/2"x11" 20# Ivory RM 195|NO BID - 4.09 797.55 | NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 3.71 723.45
140022** [Paper, Dual Purpose/Xerographic 8-1/2"x14" 20# Blue RM 3|NO BID - 5.51 16.53 [ NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 4.99 14.97
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EXHIBIT "B"

VENDOR BID FORMS

BID #17-019 General Office, Paper, Art Supplies ART PAPER Company Name
QTY UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT UNIT TOTAL UNIT
Item # Description Line 1 Description Line 2 U/M|ORDER| COST COST UNIT COST | TOTAL COST | COST COST COST COST COST TOTAL COST | COST COST COST | TOTAL COST
140023** |Paper, Dual Purpose/Xerographic 8-1/2"x14" 20# Canary RM 2[NO BID - 5.51 11.02 [ NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 4.99 9.98
140024** |Paper, Dual Purpose/Xerographic 8-1/2"x14" 20# Goldenrod RM 3|NO BID - 5.51 16.53 [ NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -
140025** |Paper, Dual Purpose/Xerographic 8-1/2"x14" 20# Green RM 4[NO BID - 5.51 22.04 | NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 4.99 19.96
140026** |Paper, Dual Purpose/Xerographic 8-1/2"x14" 20# Pink RM 9|NO BID - 5.51 49.59 [ NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 7.26 65.34
140027** |Paper, Dual Purpose/Xerographic 8-1/2"x14" 20# Salmon RM 3|NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -
140028** |Paper, Dual Purpose/Xerographic 8-1/2"x14" 20# White RM 236|NO BID - 4.31 1,017.16 | NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 39.27 9,267.72
NEW Glue, Purple 1.41 oz Blick, NO SUBSITITUTES EA 3000|NO BID - NO BID - |NOBID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -
NEW Makers, Crayola Fine Tip Class Pack, 10 Colors Set of 200 EA 20[NO BID - NO BID - _INOBID - NO BID - 39.85 797.00 | NO BID - 40.60 812.00
NEW Markers, Crayola, Class Sets EA 20[NO BID - NO BID - _INOBID - NO BID - 44.45 889.00 | NO BID - 54.59 1,091.80
NEW Eraser, Vinyl Faber Castell EA 100|NO BID - 0.57 57.00 [NO BID - NO BID - 0.09 9.00 | NO BID - 0.06 6.00
NEW Glue, Washable, No Run School, 40z Crayola, NO SUBSITITUTES EA 100{NO BID - 0.71 71.00 [INO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 0.79 79.00
NEW Paint, Tempra, 32 oz. Violet QT 10|{NO BID - 11.90 119.00 [NO BID - NO BID - 1.74 17.40 | NO BID - 1.85 18.50
NEW Marker, Sharpie, Assorted Color Sets, 24 Colors, Fine Point NO SUBSTITUTES ST 10|{NO BID - 16.34 163.40 [NO BID - NO BID - 11.61 116.10 | NO BID - 13.84 138.40
NEW Marker, Sharpie, Assorted Color Sets, 24 Colors, Extra Fine Point [NO SUBSTITUTES ST 10|{NO BID - 16.34 163.40 [NO BID - NO BID - 11.62 116.20 | NO BID - 13.84 138.40
NEW Markers, Crayola Bold, 8 color EA 100|NO BID - 243 243.00 [NO BID - NO BID - 1.48 148.00 | NO BID - 2.55 255.00
NEW Markers, Crayola Bright, 8 color EA 100|NO BID - 2.56 256.00 [NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 2.55 255.00
NEW Penciles, Woodless Colored, 24 Colors Koh-I-Noor Woodless Colored Pe|ST 10|{NO BID - 28.40 284.00 [NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - 9.82 98.20
TOTAL | 6,775.19 TOTAL 271,730.56 | TOTAL | 32,957.90 | TOTAL 9,148.20 | TOTAL 44,411.50 | TOTAL [ 16,086.45] TOTAL 537,002.47
MANUFACTURER DISCOUNT] 40% UP TO 10% 10% 5.00% - 20% 35%
100,000+ - 3%
200,000+ - 3.5% 1.00 TO 50,000 - 1%
REBATES INCENTIVES - 300,000+ - 4% - - - - 50,000+ - 2%
ABILITY TO INFACE WITH SKYWARD NO YES NO NO NO RESPONSE YES YES
24 HOUR DELIVERY SERVICE YES YES NO YES WITH CHARGE NO RESPONSE NO YES
48 HOUR DELIVERY SERVICE YES YES YES YES NO RESPONSE YES YES
ABILITY TO RESTRICT ITEMS IN THE ONLINE PORTAL NO YES YES NO NO RESPONSE YES YES
NUMBER OF PRODUCTS OFFERINGS 5 267 12 12 NO RESPONSE 16 292
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